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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 5:10 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Outstanding Payment for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041

Dear Mdm, 

 

              No PO number, just quite the case reference J/20190706/2041, is via ad-hoc small value purchase.  

 

 

Regards, 

Debbie Leong  
Investigation Officer 

Jurong Police Division  

Special Victims Unit 

67910000 

 

      

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 

Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 

an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 

 

 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 9:42 AM 

To: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Outstanding Payment for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 

 

Dear Debbie, 

 

Have any PO number apply for this case or we can just mentioned the claim reference of J/20190706/2041? 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 5:40 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Outstanding Payment for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 
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Dear LKK Auto, 

 

              Kindly submit e-invoice through Vendors@GOV. 

 

2.           Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

Debbie Leong  
Investigation Officer 

Jurong Police Division  

Special Victims Unit 

67910000 

 

      

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 

Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 

an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 

 

 

 

From: Shu Hui CHOK (SPF) <CHOK_Shu_Hui@spf.gov.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 2:49 PM 

To: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jian Sheng NG (SPF) <NG_Jian_Sheng@spf.gov.sg>; Khum Thong LEE (SPF) <LEE_Khum_Thong@spf.gov.sg>; 

Haslina OMAR (SPF) <Haslina_OMAR@spf.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Outstanding Payment for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 

 

Greetings,  

 

We have not received any e-invoice from the vendor. The hardcopy of the Vendor’s own invoice does not count. 

 

Please get vendor submit their e-invoice thru vendors@gov. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

 
Chok Shu Hui 

Jurong Division 

Singapore Police Force 
DID: (65) 6316 7636 | FAX: (65) 6896 5647 
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Singapore Police Force – Commemorating 200 Years of Policing    

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 

an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 
 

From: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 2:18 PM 

To: Shu Hui CHOK (SPF) <CHOK_Shu_Hui@spf.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jian Sheng NG (SPF) <NG_Jian_Sheng@spf.gov.sg>; Khum Thong LEE (SPF) <LEE_Khum_Thong@spf.gov.sg> 

Subject: Outstanding Payment for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Mdm, 

 

              LKK Auto has informed me that they have not yet received payment for the invoice attached. 

 

2.           Inspection was completed and inspection report received in Aug 2020. 

 

3.           Kindly assist. 

 

 

Regards, 

Debbie Leong  
Investigation Officer 

Jurong Police Division  

Special Victims Unit 

67910000 

 

      

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 

Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 

copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is 

an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error. 

 

 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 12:43 PM 

To: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Quotation for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 
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Dear Debbie, 

 

Kindly provide us the PO of above mentioned. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF) <Debbie_JL_LEONG@spf.gov.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 31 July 2020 3:48 AM 

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; tanjiatshee@gmail.com; yeojeffrey@stengg.com 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Quotation for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

                Any updates on the quotation? 

 

2.            I note that my request was sent more than 2 weeks ago (on 14/07/20). 

 

3.            Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

  
Debbie Leong Jia Ling 

Investigation Officer | General Investigation Squad (GIS) 2 
Investigation Branch | Jurong Division 
Singapore Police Force 
TEL: 6791 0000 
  

 

  

   

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any 
action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please 
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 
 
 

 

 

From: Debbie JL LEONG (SPF)  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 3:58 PM 

To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'tanjiatshee@gmail.com' <tanjiatshee@gmail.com>; 

'yeojeffrey@stengg.com' <yeojeffrey@stengg.com> 

Cc: 'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Quotation for E-bicycle brake inspection vide J/20190706/2041 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
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                I am writing to seek a quotation for PMD (e-scooter) brake inspection. 

 

2.            This inspection is required to assist in investigations vide J/20190706/2041. 

 

3.            Kindly contact me at 98312235 if any clarifications are required. 

 

4.            Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

  
Debbie Leong Jia Ling 

Investigation Officer | General Investigation Squad (GIS) 2 
Investigation Branch | Jurong Division 
Singapore Police Force 
DID: 6316 7374 | HP: 9831 2235 
  

 

  

   

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any 
action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please 
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 
 
 

 


