
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 02/12/2020

Your Ref. No. : DM20HO01224 / SG

Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI20009319/Upa3q2

: $ 4,494.21         

: $ days

Rental (If any)      : $ 385.20            days 

: $ 2.00                

: $

4,881.41         

: $ 4,881.41         

:

 

1)                   : $ 4,881.41                                

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

JOANNE LEE

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)
Vehicle No.

19/8/2020

YP 9456D

SKV 7029B

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

100%

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability
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RE: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKV7029B // DOA: 19/08/2020// LKK Ref:
CC4/EQI20009319/Upa3 (YP9456D)

Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>
Thu 19/11/2020 2:12 PM
To:  Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>; Jessica Harry Shastri <jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald
Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>

1 attachments (306 KB)
3898_001.pdf;

Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
The repairs have been completed for SKV7029B. We submit the following claims with supporting
documents for your perusal:-
 

1)      Invoice No. 30075408 $4,494.21
2)      Loss of Rental (Invoice #22706 ) $385.20
3)      LTA/GIA Search Fees $2.00
4)      Le�er of Authoriza�on  
5)      Discharge Voucher  

Please pay $4,496.21 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd,
$385.20 to Eurokars Leasing Pte Ltd

$4,881.41

 
We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon.
 
 
Regards,
JEN LIM
Insurance Claims Admin
TEL: 6331 0698
27A, Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 19 November 2020 9:01 AM 
To: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg> 
Subject: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKV7029B // DOA: 19/08/2020// LKK Ref: CC4/EQI20009319/Upa3
(YP9456D)
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
For COR, recommended amount at P/P $4,200.20(before GST) with 03 repair days.
 
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisa�on to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary ac�on.
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Thanks.
 
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

 
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of
claim related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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RE: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKV7029B // DOA: 19/08/2020// LKK Ref:
CC4/EQI20009319/Upa3 (YP9456D)

Stephen Quah <stephen.quah@mazda.com.sg>
Thu 19/11/2020 5:32 PM
To:  Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>; SG Mazda AR Team <SGMazdaARteam@eurokars.com.sg>
Cc:  Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>; Jessica Harry Shastri <jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald
Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Hi Jen,
 
As per requested.
 

Account Name  TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
Account Number  003-916027-5
Bank Name  DBS BANK LTD
Bank Code  7171
Branch Code  003

 
With Regards,
Mazda AR Team
Email: SGMazdaARteam@eurokars.com.sg
 
 
From: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>  
Sent: 19 November 2020 15:36 PM 
To: SG Mazda AR Team <SGMazdaARteam@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>; Jessica Harry Shastri
<jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKV7029B // DOA: 19/08/2020// LKK Ref:
CC4/EQI20009319/Upa3 (YP9456D)
 
Hi Finance Team,
 
Please assist to fill in TEPL account details.
 
Regards,
JEN LIM
Insurance Claims Admin
TEL: 6331 0698
27A, Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 19 November 2020 2:57 PM 
To: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>; Jessica Harry Shastri
<jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: [Request for LOD & Docs]- You Ref: SKV7029B // DOA: 19/08/2020// LKK Ref:
CC4/EQI20009319/Upa3 (YP9456D)
 

mailto:SGMazdaARteam@eurokars.com.sg
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 2 September 2020 2:03 PM
To: MELISSA@TTK-SERVICES.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 9456D(EQ) AND SKV 7029B AT/ALONG GEYLANG 

METHODIST SECONDARY SCHOOL ON 19/08/2020

02 Sept 2020                                                                       
                                                                
M/S TTK SERVICES PTE LTD                                                   [By Email Only] 
Attn: The Management 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: YP9456D 
Our Ref: CC4/EQI20009319/pa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 9456D(EQ) AND SKV 7029B AT/ALONG GEYLANG METHODIST SECONDARY SCHOOL ON 
19/08/2020 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SKV7029B against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver’s favour as your lorry had collided 
onto third party parked vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third 
Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
“Please note EQ Insurance reserves all rights to seek recovery if the Insured and/or Authorized Driver is later 
found to be in breach of policy terms and conditions.” 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 


