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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 25 November 2020 1:41 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: FW: Our Ref : D20003493MFSH / FW: MANDATE REQUEST ON QUANTUM AND 

LIABILITY - EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8287U (OI : FCI - 
TBA) and SJE3779Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20009293/Aka3) on 29/08/2020

 
 

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2020 1:39 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: Our Ref : D20003493MFSH / FW: MANDATE REQUEST ON QUANTUM AND LIABILITY 
- EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8287U (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJE3779Y (TP : 
LKK REF - CC6/FCI20009293/Aka3) on 29/08/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna, 
 
Pls offer as per below : 
 
COR - $4,387 
LOU - $400 to $600 ($80 to $100 x 5 to 6 days) 
LTA FEE - $7.45 
TOTAL - $4,794.45 to $4,994.45 
 
Pls request for final repair tax invoice. 
 
Regards 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 
195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
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From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 2:03 pm 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: MANDATE REQUEST ON QUANTUM AND LIABILITY - EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK 
- Accident Involving SH8287U (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJE3779Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20009293/Aka3) 
on 29/08/2020 
 
YOUR REF: TBA 
LKK REF: CC6/FCI20009293/Aga3q2 
 

Dear  Chris, 

We refer to the above matter.  

Liability: (BOLA 28) 

Remarks: 3 vehicle chain collision, Insured vehicle is second 

We seek your approval to offer third party repairer “MG SOLUTION PTE LTD ” at $4,994.45 ~ $ 5,114.45(all 
in). 

The summary is as follows: - 

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $ 11,532.80 $ 4,387.00 

2. Loss of Use ( 6 days x $240 )  $ 1,440.00 $ 600.00 ~ 720.00  ( 6 days x $100 ~ $120)  

3. LTA Search  $ 7.45 $ 7.45 

Total $ 12,980.25 $4,994.45 ~ $ 5,114.45 

Surveyor recommended 6 days for repair  

Enclosed herewith all the documents for your perusal. 

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 

Thank you. 

 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 


