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Re: YP6793A & SMK1830C ON 28/08/2020 - CHINA TAIPING *** LKK
REF:CC6/CTI20009284/Aes3

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Thu 10/8/2020 2:22 PM
To:  Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

‘WITHOUT	PREJUDICE’
		SAVE	AS	TO	COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,  

We refer to the above ma�er.
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submi�ed by both par�es, the liability is
clear / under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline se�lement)  and shall proceed with direct se�lement
for the above men�oned case.
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisa�on
of repair to your client’s vehicle.
 
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by
our surveyor.

Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, October 7, 2020 4:33 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: YP6793A & SMK1830C ON 28/08/2020 - CHINA TAIPING *** LKK REF:CC6/CTI20009284/Aes3
 
Dear Asher

Pls help to check the liability.

Thank You.
 

Regards,
Jing Yee

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com


10/8/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/AAMkAGVlNDlkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTE0MGFhMgAuAAAAAADlYOFhwsDxTrGjt1lk28ch… 2/3

Hua Meng Spray Pain�ng Workshop
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C
#01-34/#01-61
Singapore 417883
 Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, October 2, 2020 12:52 PM
To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: YP6793A & SMK1830C ON 28/08/2020 - CHINA TAIPING *** LKK REF:CC6/CTI20009284/Aes3
 
Dear	Sir	/	Madam,
	
We	refer	to	the	above	matter.
	
Please	be	informed	that	OI	has	reported.	Please	refer	to	the	below	OI’s	sketch	plan	and	statement.
	

	
Please	provide	us	the	following.

evidence	i.e.	video	and	scene	photo.
PIR	result	(if	any)

	
Please	note	that	for	liability,	claim	negotiation	and	settlement,	please	contact	Asher	via	email.
	
To	check	availability	of	the	case	handler,	you	may	contact	the	undersigned.
	
Thank you.
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Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission
of claim related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed
 
From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 2 October, 2020 12:38 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Subject: YP6793A & SMK1830C ON 28/08/2020 - CHINA TAIPING
 
Dear Mei Kwan
 
Pls help to check the liability.
 
Thank You.
 
 
Regards,
Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C
#01-34/#01-61
Singapore 417883
 Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896
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