Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Francis Cher TCBC <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, September 25, 2020 4:31 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SLG8809C AFTER PAINT PHOTOS

Attachments: 25092020162908-0001.pdf

Hi. Sun Pin

Attached final bill for you to finalize.

Regards

Francis Cher

From: Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, September 25, 2020 4:25 PM

To: Francis Cher TCBC <francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLG8809C AFTER PAINT PHOTOS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Francis,

Kindly refer the finalize Repair cost $13,000. Repair day 12 days. (before gst)
Please confirm the COR by reply email.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Qi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933

From: Francis Cher TCBC [mailto:francis.cher@borneomotors.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, September 14, 2020 9:31 AM
To: Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>



