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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 September 2020 7:46 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMH 3909M-DOA: 27/8/20 (III OD)

Attachments: SMH 3909 M (OD).pdf

Dear Veron, 

 

Attach our final bill, insurer discharge voucher & authorisation letter signed by insured for your 

reference & attention, we will forwards the original documents to the insurer (III) directly, 

 

On Thu, 3 Sep 2020 at 16:38, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear David, 

  

Supplementary approved. 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 3 September 2020 11:41 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMH 3909M-DOA: 27/8/20 (III OD) 

  

Dear Veron, 
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Noted with Thanks  

  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Wed, 2 Sep 2020 at 16:45, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear David, 

  

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMH 3909M, (Excess $600-). 

  

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

  

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

  

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 

Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

 

 

 

--  
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 

Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  


