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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 July 2021 12:35 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Fwd: SML5549J & SML842U DOA 27.08.2020
Attachments: LOA.jpg; LTA.pdf; INVOICE.pdf; SML 5549J - GIA report (27.08.20).pdf

 
 
Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Chris Chan <chanpickyuen@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 22, 2021 12:33:17 PM 
To: chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com> 
Subject: SML5549J & SML842U DOA 27.08.2020  
  
Dear Sir / Mdm ,   
 
Enclosed is our client's GIA , LOA , LTA fee & invoice .  
As request following :  
 

1. RC              $ 8774 ( $8200 + 7% GST ) -As agreed  
2. loss of use  $1200 ( $120 X 10 Days - 8 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRI + 1 Day weekend = TOTAL10 

days  1800cc under leasing company 
3. LTA              $7.45  

@ 100% ( video whatadd to Ms Hsiao Tong 22.7.21 - exit from minor rd without stop & give way to main incoming 
veh . )  
 
Total      $ 9981.45/-  
 
Please let us have your offer soon due to KIV very long for finalised . Thanks  
 
Best  Regards  
Chris Chan  
GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD  
HP: 92712214 
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