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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 12 October, 2020 5:50 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balqish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto 

Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalqishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 

IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) 

<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>; Foo Chit Yan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FooChitYan@smrt.com.sg> 

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/08/20/1030 - ACCIDENT ON 18/08/20 INVOLVING SMB3591B AND SMP9603M ALONG JALAN 

TOA PAYOH (AFTER BS:52089-OPP BLK 195) 

 
Dear Sirs,  

  

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB3591B.  Your client's 

negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,  
 

Cost of Repair $1,316.00            

Loss of Use $875.00  ( 2.5 days x $350.00  ) 

LTA search fee $7.00            

Total $2,198.00            

 

We enclose the following documents,                                                                                                                                  

1)   1) Repair Invoice 

2)   2) GIA report 

3) LTA Search Fee 

  

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment 

by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.  

 

Thanks & Regards 

Hua Yen 
 





SurUser6
Stamp







1

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 November 2020 12:26 PM

To: TAMMIE_THAM@HOTMAIL.COM

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 9603M & SMB 3591B ALONG/AT JALAN TOA PAYOH 

(AFTER BS:52089-OPP BLK 195 ON 18/08/2020

Our Ref: CC3/AIG20009079/Qra3 

 

THAM HWEE ENG– BY EMAIL ONLY 

[POLICY HOLDER] 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

                                                         

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 9603M & SMB 3591B ALONG/AT JALAN TOA PAYOH (AFTER BS:52089-OPP BLK 

195 ON 18/08/2020 

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 

you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from SMB 3591B against your motor insurance policy. 

                 

Based on the circumstances of accident and both parties damage profile, we are of the view that both parties should 

exercise caution when merging. The case would be resolved at equal liability. Therefore, we will proceed to negotiate 

for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 

 

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in 

writing within the next 7 days i.e. by 02/12/2020, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party 

claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your 

driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 

 

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 

vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it 

will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 

(Motor Claims Dept) 

 

 

 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> SMRT BUSES LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 198202292D. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(204094) Alexander Dennis ENVIRO500 8.8 D (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Clm Created
Reg No: SMB3591B. Acct Date: 2020/08/18. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt
d. (SG). TP Insurer: MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ). Workshop: SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(Woodlands)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/09/07 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
27 Aug
2020
16:35

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Exp
ress)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
27 Aug
2020
16:36

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
27 Aug
2020
16:36

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> OI SUN PIN [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
30 Nov
2020
14:32

Adj Im.
Advice
Submitted

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/09/07 [A] Jaslin
Kok Chin Yi

11
30 Nov
2020
14:35

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2023.00:Liability:50%(Merging lane)*Quantum:(a)COR:$1,316.00+ (b)LOU(2days x $350.0
0):$700.00 + (c) LTA/ GIA search fee:$7.00 = Total:$2,023.00 *Vehicle Model: Alexander Dennis Enviro
500 * Recommended 2 repair days

[A] Jaslin
Kok Chin Yi

12
01 Dec
2020
12:13

Adj
Mandate
Request
Cancelled

[A] Jaslin
Kok Chin Yi

13
01 Dec
2020
12:27

Adj Im.
Advice
Submitted

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/09/07 [A] Jaslin
Kok Chin Yi

14
01 Dec
2020
12:29

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:1015.00:Liability:50%(Merging lane)*Quantum:(a)COR:$1,316.00+(b)LOU(2days x $350.0
0):$700.00 = Total:$1,008.00 (Base on 50& liability) + (c) LTA/ GIA search fee:$7.00 = Total:$1,015.00
*Vehicle Model: Alexander Dennis Enviro500 * Recommended

[A] Jaslin
Kok Chin Yi

15
30 Dec
2020
10:54

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/09/07. Mandate Remarks: please submit interim report and reseek m
andate

[I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

16
30 Dec
2020
10:54

Adj
Mandate
Set

Maintained:please submit interim report and reseek mandate [I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

17
07 Jan
2021
17:19

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
07 Jan
2021
17:19

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
07 Jan
2021
17:19

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2015/05/04.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
07 Jan
2021
17:19

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

21
11 Jan
2021
14:38

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2073.00:Lia:50%(MERGING)*Quantum:(a)CORw/GST: $1,316 + (b)LOU(2.5days x $300):$750
+ (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $7 = Total(50%):$1,040.00*Vehicle Model: Alexander Dennis*Recommended
2 repair days + 0.5 PRS=2.5DAYS

[A] Jaslin
Kok Chin Yi

22
09 Mar
2021
14:24

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2020/09/07. Mandate Remarks: mandate approved. please ensure offer
is at 50% LOB.

[I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

23
09 Mar
2021
14:24

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:1015.00:mandate approved. please ensure offer is at 50% LOB. [I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

Date From    Date To    Audit Type None Go

 
ACTIVITY
No record
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