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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 11:11 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 

26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3 

Attachments: 4618_001.pdf

Dear Jaslin, 

 
Above is the attach signed DV.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 18 December 2020 8:48 am 

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 

sender and know the content is safe. 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for acceptance. 
  
Please duly sign the Discharge Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 
 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 1:41 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 
Dear Jaslin, 

 
We are looking at full settlement. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 12:28 pm 

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 

sender and know the content is safe. 

 

Dear Vincent 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 20,330.00  

2. Loss of Rental (22 days x $100.00) (w/GST)  $ 2,354.00  

3. Loss of Use (01 day x $50.00)  $ 50.00  

Total  $ 22,734.00  

Please confirm acceptance. 
 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 



3

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 4:45 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 
Dear Jaslin, 

 
We are unable to accept your offer, we are looking on full settlement amount at $22,791.03. 

 
Thank you.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 4:20 pm 

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 

sender and know the content is safe. 

 

Your Ref: SLK 2027K 

LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3q2                                               Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 1456B AND SLK 2027K ON 26.08.2020 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement at a global sum of $22,600.00(all-in). 

Please confirm acceptance. 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 
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Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 4:40 PM 

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Desmond  
 

We are currently preparing our report to seek mandate from insurer, shall revert to you once approved. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 4:20 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 
Dear Jaslin, 

 
Any outcome on the above case. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Desmond Toh  

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 4:41 pm 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 
Dear Jaslin, 

 
Above is the attach LOD. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 4:21 pm 

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20009048/Qrs3  

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 

sender and know the content is safe. 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 
Dear Desmond 
 
Please provide us a copy of your document for third party direct settlement claim for our necessary action. 
 
Moving forward, You may forward your documents to us directly. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Desmond Toh [mailto:desmondtoh@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: 24 November 2020 09:40 

To: CWS Motor Claims 

Cc: Winson Chow; Jerome Tan; Leon Lim 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH  

 

 
[External Email Warning: Do not click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is 
reliable] 

Dear All, 
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Any outcome on the above case.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Desmond Toh  

Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 11:47 am 

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Winson Chow <winsonchow@honda.com.sg>; Jerome Tan <jerometan@honda.com.sg>; Leon Lim <leonlim@honda.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH  

 
Dear All, 

 
Any outcome on the above case.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Desmond Toh  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 2:35 pm 

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Winson Chow <winsonchow@honda.com.sg>; Jerome Tan <jerometan@honda.com.sg>; Leon Lim <leonlim@honda.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SLK2027K and SHC1456B on 26.08.2020 - D20003420MFSH  

 

Your Ref: SHC1456B Your Ref: SHC1456B Your Ref: SHC1456B Your Ref: SHC1456B ----    D20003420MFSHD20003420MFSHD20003420MFSHD20003420MFSH    

    

    

Our Ref: SLK2027K 

 

 

M/s:M/s:M/s:M/s:                First Capital Insurance LtdFirst Capital Insurance LtdFirst Capital Insurance LtdFirst Capital Insurance Ltd    

              36 Robinson Road                        

              #16-01 City House                       

              Singapore 068877                        

Attn:     Motor Claims Department 
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Dear All, 

 

Above is the attached document for third party direct settlement claim. 

 

Kindly provide us your finalized settlement & payment as your soonest . 

 

We’ll appreciate if you could reply to us once receive this email 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Desmond Toh 

Contact No: 6514 5848 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905 

 
 

From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 2:21 pm 

To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 

Subject: Attached Image 

 

 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above 
and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of 
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and 
delete the mail. Thank you. 

“Please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity (ies) to whom they are 

addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are not the intended recipient, 

request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies or attachments from your system. Any 

unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this communication to anyone is strictly prohibited and 

punishable by law. 

  

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this e-mail are of the sender and ICICI Lombard General Insurance 

Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless confirmed by an authorized 

representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the consequences of any viruses that may be 

transmitted with this email.”  
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Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual 
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from 
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete 
the mail. Thank you. 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual 
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from 
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete 
the mail. Thank you. 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual 
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from 
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete 
the mail. Thank you. 

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 

this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet. 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual 
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from 
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete 
the mail. Thank you. 


