11/20/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: OUR REF : KK2008-38 FBQ7803R

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Fri 11/20/2020 3:48 PM

To: karzworks <karzworks.sg@gmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

[ﬂJ 1 attachments (329 KB)
Ol PIR.PDF;

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We attached here with a copy of our insured’s police investigation result for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Your client
has charged by the traffic police for careless driving.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and
unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 4:31 PM

To: karzworks <karzworks.sg@gmail.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; karzworks <KARZWORKS.SG@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: OUR REF : KK2008-38 FBQ7803R

Without Prejudice

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/search/id/AAQKAGVINDIKMTdLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTEOMGFhMgAQAHqry42k5%2BFDiYPxg2...  1/2


mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com

11/20/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook
Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Asher,

FYNA, our ref CC4/A1G20009041/R1es3

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 1467 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721)

From: karzworks [mailto:karzworks.sg@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 November 2020 4:26 PM

To: Admin A; CS A Team

Cc: karzworks

Subject: OUR REF : KK2008-38 FBQ7803R

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

We enclosed herewith Letter of Demand for your kind attention.
Please let us have your offer soonest.

Thank you and have a nice day.

Regards,

Shu Shan

KARZ WORKS PTE LTD

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-23 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 2475

Fax: 6844 2474
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AIG Ref: #3311061711SG003#027# // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBC 111Z AND FBQ 7803R
ON 24/08/2020

Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>
Fri 11/20/2020 2:35 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Hi Asher,

Please proceed to reject.

However, before rejection, ensure that Ol vehicle was signaling when turning left?

Is TPWS an ARC?
If yes, then they can’t litigate.

If not, try to reject amicably without them taking further action to litigate the matter.
Reason being that under MAG 31(d), Ol has to take on some apportionment, depending on if he signals or not,
which may result in increased unnecessary litigation cost.

Thanks and Regards

Jeremy Goh

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1767

Jeremy.Goh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, November 20, 2020 12:42 PM

To: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your Ref: 3311061711SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBC 111Z AND FBQ 7803R ON 24/08/2020

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBC 111Z AND FBQ 7803R ON 24/08/2020
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Based on the evidence that third party charged by the traffic police for careless driving.

We are of the opinion that the liability in not third party favour.

In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss
or damage arising in any way from its use.
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