Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: simon@kkimhin.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, 27 August 2020 12:22 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: survey@kkimhin.com.sg; service@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: RE: LPC OD VEHICLE GX 892H DOA: 09/08/2020
Hi,

We will accept your offer limit repair at lump sum $15800.00

Regards
Simon

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 27 August 2020 12:10 PM

To: Simon <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>

Subject: LPC OD VEHICLE GX 892H DOA: 09/08/2020

Dear Simon,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly check whether your workshop able to repair the above vehicle at repair cost not more that Lump Sum
$15,800.00. (Subject approval from insurance)

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



