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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 November 2020 10:42 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A

Cc: Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jessica Harry Shastri; Jess Francis Carlos

Subject: RE: FCI - SMS2097D Third Party  Your ref: SH6848P DOA: 22/08/2020 (MAZDA)

Attachments: 3816_001.pdf

Dear Claims Admin, 

 

The repairs have been completed for SMS2097D. We submit the following claims with supporting documents for your 

perusal:- 

 

1) Invoice No. 30015382 $6,089.26 

2) Loss of Rental (Invoice #22338 ) $642.00  

3) LTA/GIA Search Fees  

4) Letter of Authorization  

5) Discharge Voucher  

Please pay $6,089.26 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd,  

$642.00 to Eurokars Leasing Pte Ltd  

$6,731.26 

 

We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon.  

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

JEN LIM 
Insurance Claims Admin 
TEL: 6331 0698 
27A, Tanjong Penjuru  
Singapore 609042 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: 11 November 2020 1:57 PM 

To: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FCI - SMS2097D FCOR (MAZDA) 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

For COR, surveyor recommended amount at P/P $5,690.90(before GST) with 6 repair days. 

 

*** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental 

receipt to us (LKK) for our necessary action) 

 

Please note that all finalisation subject to insurer’s approval. 
 

Thank you. 










