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Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SLU8632X *** LKK REF:CC4/AIG20008915/Kea3 (TP AIG)

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Wed 9/2/2020 11:30 AM
To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall
proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of
repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted via email.

Thank You.

Best Regardis,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

d,

Note: We are on work from home arrang . All corresp e should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is

much regretted.

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, September 1, 2020 5:54 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SLU8632X *** LKK REF:CC4/AIG20008915/Kea3 (TP AlG)

RE-SEND
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 10:06 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: CHENG HOE (AMK) HOE MOTOR SERVICE (AMK)

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SLU8632X *** | KK REF:CC4/AIG20008915/Kea3 (TP AIG)

Good morning Asher,
Kindly advise on liability please.
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, August 28, 2020 9:47 AM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) ; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SLU8632X *** | KK REF:CC4/AIG20008915/Kea3
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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SXETCH PLAN

VEHICLE A: CBL3E9SU VERIQEC: SLUSEIX
VEMICLES: SMF7535P VEHICLE D: Svs565%

DESCRISE COIRCUMS ; ANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
ON 21/08/2000, AT AROLND £ 36504, | WAS DRIVING ALONG 715 TOWARDS 3EDOK RS ON THE 280 LANE.

WHEN | SAW THE TRAFFIC AKEAD SLOW DOWN, | APPLIED BRAKE TO SLOW DOWN. AT THIS MOMENT THE VEMICLE "8" SMPTSIEF HIT ONTD MY VEHIC

FROM EZHIND. THE IMPACT CAUSED MY VEMICLE MOVED FORWARD AND HIT ONTO VEHICLE *C™ SLUSEAIX. LATER THAT, | REALITED THAT THERE ARE
4 YE-LCLES INVOLYING IN THIS ACCICENT

—_

Please provide us the following.

* evidence i.e. video and scene photo.

¢ PIR result (if any)
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 27 August, 2020 3:14 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SLU8632X

Dear Sir,

OUR CLIENT - SLU8632X

DOA - 21.8.2020@4.30pm

AIG
INSURED - GBD9899U

Attached our client report.
Kindly let us have the statement/sketch plan of GBD9899U if you have it.

Also, pls advise who is the officer-in-charge.
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Thank you.

Regards

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719
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