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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

Claimant's Name: -> -. [A] LEe Su
(206086) ADIVA AD1 200 190cc 3W. (A] Lee Su

Reg No: SMR3923T. Acct Date: 2020/08/19. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Insurance Pte [A] Lee Su

Ltd (HQ). Workshop: F1 Garage (HQ) Li
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] LL‘f;e Su
Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/09/03 [A] LL‘f;e Su
Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] LLe;e Su
(30653):Direct Settlement. [A] LI:eie Su
[None] -> ADRIAN LING [A] Lfie Su
Cur.Req:0.00:PODS LIABILITY: 100% REMARKS: BOLA S27 [Ap]uﬂ‘_?n”g

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/09/03. Mandate Remarks: Agreed to do direct settlement. Revert wit [I] Sundari
h your quantum advice. Request video from TP Nagarajan

Approved:0.00:Agreed to do direct settlement. Revert with your quantum advice. Request video from T [I] Sundari
P Nagarajan

Cur.Req:0.00:PODS HI, TP PASS CASE TO LAWYER FOR HANDLING. AS RECEIVE TP LAWYER EMAIL ON [A] Chong

THE VIDEO FOOTAGE. THUS, WILL PROCEED TO SUBMIT WP AND CLOSE THE CASE. THANKS Pui Lin

] H | pate To 4] 3 I| Audit Type | None v

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

2569207

26 Aug 2020 TP Case

08:38:54

LKK Auto | I“dif |
Motor Consultants | _nwernationa SMR3923T SHC2913S 11.00
(Insurer) Pte Ltd Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: claims@juseqg.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 10:19 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: SMR 3923T (OUR REF: CC4/11120008875/Ags3 ) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SHC 2913S & SMR 3923T ON 19/08/2020 ***

Attachments: VIDEO.MP4

Importance: High

Dear Cecilia

Your Ref: CC4/11120008875/Ags3
Our Ref: JEQ/200578/0820 (F1)

Your email below refers.

As requested, we attach herewith copy of our client’s video footage for your perusal.
Please state your Principals’ position on our client’s claim on an urgent basis.
Regards

Kevin Foo
On behalf of Mr. David Siow
JusEquity Law Corporation

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Date: Fri, 13 Nov 2020, 11:56

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SMR 3923T (OUR REF: CC4/11120008875/Ags3 ) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHC 2913S & SMR 3923T ON 19/08/2020 ***

To: alfred ng@juseq.com.sg <alfred ng@juseq.com.sg>

2ND REMINDER

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Alfred,

We refer to the above matter



