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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 9:48 AM

To: Ryder Auto workshop

Cc: SUR; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SMH 8779M FINALIZE

Dear Orson, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Amount $21,943.47 confirmed @ 14 days 

 

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE  

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 September 2020 7:58 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMH 8779M FINALIZE 

 

Dear Vernon, 

 

Through Audatex. 

 

Best regards 

 

Orson 

 

On Wed, 16 Sep 2020 at 4:54 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Orson, 

  

No attachment. 

  

Please assign to Audatex for surveyor to review. 
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 September 2020 2:38 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMH 8779M FINALIZE 

  

Dear Veron, 

  

I have resend you the estimate, please check if it is ok. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best regards 

  

Orson 

 

 

 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921 

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 
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On Tue, Sep 15, 2020 at 4:27 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Orson, 

  

Please hold on the finalize. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 September 2020 3:18 PM 

To: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SMH 8779M FINALIZE 

  

Dear Orson, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Confirmed $23,898.63 @ 14 working days. 

  

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING 

INSURANCE  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 11 September 2020 11:09 AM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMH8779M FINALIZE 

  

Dear Steve/Veron, 

  

Kindly ignore previous attachment and view current. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best Regards 

  

Orson 
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2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921 

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 

 

 

  

  

  

On Fri, Sep 11, 2020 at 9:33 AM Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Steve/Veron, 

  

Kindly view attachment. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best regards 

  

Orson 

 

 

 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921 

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 
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On Thu, Sep 10, 2020 at 8:41 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Orson, 

  

I have put marking beside the price. Kindly amend the Audatex. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Thanks. 

  

Best Regards, 

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 

  

LKK Auto Consultants 

  

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

  



7

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2020 4:23 PM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) 

Subject: FW: SMH8779M FINALIZE 

  

Hi Steve, 

  

For your finalize. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 10 September 2020 1:21 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMH8779M FINALIZE 

  

Dear Veron, 

  

Kindly view attachment. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best regards 
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Orson 

 

 

 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921 

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 

 

 

  

--  

 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921 
Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277 

 

 
 


