
OD NEW ASSIGNMENT - GBG3751K (OI) ON D.O.A. 20/08/2020

From: Chin, Lee-Ying

To: assignments, Admin A

Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong

Sent: Sunday, 23 August, 2020 6:56:46 PM

Attachments: 3751 3751 est.pdf

Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Lee Ying, Chin

AIG

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08­16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1947

Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com |www.aig.sg

From: teamautopl@gmail.com <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, August 21, 2020 4:42 PM

To: Teo, Ericweihong <Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com>

Cc: Lim, Kok­Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa 

<NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Hor, Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; Subramaniam, Divyashni 

<Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>; Chin, Lee­Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>;teamautopl@gmail.com

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM: GBG 3751 K (Our ref) DOA 20.08.2020 policy 2070102981

Dear Eric,

Attached is a copy of GIA report, will send the complete GIA report once i receveid from client. 

Estimate will be provided once ready. Meanwhile may you assist to arrange the surveyor to conduct 
the survey : 

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01­14 Sin Ming AutoCity   Singapore 575722   

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.
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Cheers,

Peach

--

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and 

shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 
personal injuries.*

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the 

next 2 months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid 

revision on final payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

 Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

From: Teo, Ericweihong
Sent: Thu, 20 Aug 2020 13:56:12 +0000

To: teamautopl@gmail.com

Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Hor, Yinrul, Subramaniam, Divyashni, Chin, 
Lee-Ying

Subject: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM: GBG 3751 K (Our ref) DOA 20.08.2020 policy 2070102981

Dear Peach,

Understand that client vehicle GBG3751K wishes to claim OD.

Kindly provide us with the estimate repair and GIA report.

Thank you.
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Regards,

Eric Teo Wei Hong

AIG

Claim Adjuster II, 

Singapore– Auto Express & FNOL

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002213

Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com | www.aig.com

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August, 2020 7:00 PM

To: Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig.com>; Chin, Lee­Ying <Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com>; Fong, Andy­SY 

<Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>; Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; Lim, Sheng Yang 

<ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; 

Supramaniam, Darshene <Darshene.Supramaniam@aig.com>; Tan, Lily (AIG) <Lily.Tan@aig.com>; Hor, 

Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] OWN DAMAGE CLAIM: GBG 3751 K (Our ref) DOA 20.08.2020 policy 2070102981

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Road Traffic Accident Involving GBG 3751 K (Our Ref) 

Dated 20TH August 2020, Time around 1340HRS

@JUNCTION OF HENDERSON RD & TIONG BAHRU RD

We represent your insured/our client 388 PTE LTD;  GBG 3751 K , to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic 

accident and your insured/our client intention for OD claim. Kindly assist to arrange the survey ASAP

Enclosed herewith the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference.

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

Cheers,

Peach

­­

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle 

and shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss 

in relation to his personal injuries.*

­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­­

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2 

months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final 

payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
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 Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 

defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility 

of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 

way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not 
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" 
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any 
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is 

received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted 
by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage 

arising in any way from its use.

Page 4 of 4OD NEW ASSIGNMENT - GBG3751K (OI) ON D.O.A. 20/08/2020

24/8/2020https://securemail2.aig.com/securereader/read.jsf


