Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 September 2020 12:07 pm
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: SLJ 573T

From: Siak Tong Sim [mailto:siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 5:38 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLJ 573T

Sun Pin
So confirm $16K to repair

On Mon, 24 Aug 2020, 17:24 Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto), <sunpin @lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Mr Sim,

Can, the limit repair 16K
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sllll Pil’ll Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Siak Tong Sim [mailto:siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 5:20 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLJ 573T

Sun Pin

Sorry typo error is 16k not 15k

On Mon, 24 Aug 2020, 17:13 Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto), <sunpin @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Sim,

SLJ573T have repair limits.

the limit of the cost of repair is $14,000
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pini Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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