Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Suan <irene@teospraytrading.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 18 September 2020 10:26 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: F 1093T - Finalize

Noted with thanks.

On Thu, Sep 17, 2020 at 6:39 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Irene,

LOD sent to Insurance.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Irene Suan [mailto:irene@teospraytrading.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, September 17, 2020 6:39 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: F 1093T - Finalize

Hi, Steve

We Confirm this amount so | proceed to send LOD to LKK?

On Thu, Sep 17, 2020 at 6:35 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Irene,

Kindly refer our finalize $814.30 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



