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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: AIG Ref: 3622526294SG-003 || Accident Involving SMC2647B / SKT6686X on 
18/08/2020

 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: 1 September 2020 11:19 AM 
To: lpchan441@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 3622526294SG-003 || Accident Involving SMC2647B / SKT6686X on 18/08/2020 
 
Our Ref:  CC3/AIG20008796/R1ks3  

 
 
CHAN LOO PING 

[POLICY HOLDER] 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                                    
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
In addition to the e-mail below dated 20/08/2020, please be informed that the third party has changed workshop and is 
now claiming through M/S Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore 
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Please call/e-mail us if you have further queries. 
 
Thank you. 
 
c.c.        AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>  
Sent: 20 August 2020 11:51 PM 
To: lpchan441@gmail.com 
Subject: AIG Ref: 3622526294SG-003 || Accident Involving SMC2647B / SKT6686X on 18/08/2020 
Importance: High 
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Dear Sir / Mdm 
 
We have received a Third Party property damage claim submitted by M/s Mova Automotive Pte Ltd acting for SKT6686X 
against your motor vehicle policy.  
 
Based on the accident reports and evidences (ie. Video Footage) provided by both parties, we regret to inform liability is 
not favourable to us. We, as your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 

 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% upon next renewal due to 
this Third Party claim.  
 
Kindly immediately forward to us any documents that you may receive from the Third Party solicitor. Should you have 
any queries / evidences in regards to this case, kindly contact us by 26th August 2020. 
 
Thank you for your kind attention and understanding. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Bennie Tan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd  
 
78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 
 
Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
 
Advanced Leave Notification: 
 
 


