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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 10:07 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Ce: LKK Valuation

Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Please provide valuation for the below vehicle:-
1) SKI507Y -Chevrolet Orlando 1.8A 5DR, road tax expired 5 Aug 2020.
Copy of vehicle registration details had been faxed.
Thank you.
Audrey Goh

DBS Bank Ltd
Tel — 6878 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Vehicle Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.
SKIs507Y

Make / Model
CHEVROLET / ORLANDO 1.8 AT ABS AIRBAG 2WD 5DR

Vehicle Type :
P11 - Passenger Station Wagon/Jeep/Land Rover

Vehicle Attachment 1:
No Attachment

Vehicle Scheme :

Normal

Chassis No. :
KL1YA7551CK616331

Propellant :
Petrol

Engine No. :
F18D4271702KA

Motor No. :

Engine Capacity :
1796 cc

Power Rating :

imum Power Output
.0 kW (139 bhp)



‘Maximum Laden Weight :
2171 kg

Unladen Weight :
1539 kg

Year Of Manufacture :
2011

Original Registration Date :
06 Feb 2013

Lifespan Expiry Date :

COE Category ;
E - Open Category

Quota Premium :

$96,101.00

COE Expiry Date :
05 Feb 2023

Road Tax Expiry Date :
05 Aug 2020

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -
05 Feb 2023

Inspection Due Date :

05 Feb 2020
Intended Transfer Date :

20 Aug 2020

CO2 Emission :
197.00 (g/km)

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised Amount :

CO Emission:

HC Emission:

NOx Emission :

@Emission :
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

WVehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner |0

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.;

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Calaur;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine MNa.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rehate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Transfer of ownership or deregistration is not allowed for this vehicle.

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 20 Aug 2020

Singapore MRIC
531E

SKJS07Y

Ma

31 Aug 2020
CHEVROLET

ORLAMDO 1.8 AT ABS AIRBAG 2WD 50DR

Sihver

2011
F1aD4271702KA
KLIYATS51CKE16331
104.0 kW (139 bhp)
$19,172.00

06 Feb 2013

04 Feb 2013

8]

$19.17200 Q _gfoCc

Yes
05 Feb 2023
$11.503.00

05 Feb 2023

E - Open Category
10

$96,101.00
$23,367.00
$34,870.00



812072020 Singapore Used Car Listings - sgCarMart

; s ARMART.COM

THE OKLY PLACE FOR SMART CAR BUYERS
Chevrolet Orlando Used Vehicle List (1 vehicles)

Car Model Price Depreciation Reg Date Eng Cap  Mileage Company Availability
Chevrolet Odando 1,84 - - 06-Feb-2013 1,796 cc 237,713 km  Repoco Agency Available

Rebate Amount As At 31 August 2020 Is $34,870, Road Tax Expiry 05/08/2020,

Office No. - 62233007
Audrey - 0 | Poh Keng - 0

sgCarMart Is the number one car classifieds for paraliel import cars, Toyota, Honda, Nissan, Mitsubishi & BMW, There are plenty of cars for sale, even for COE
cars, OPC cars, vans, trucks, hybrid cars, sports cars or stationwagons. You can also buy from a car auction, look up car loans, financial services, low mileage
cars, car brands, carpark rates & car insurance, We have new car dealers comprising parallel importers, authorised car dealers, and used car dealers on our
site. Find new car price lists, new car launches and new car promaotions, and also mataring advice, car reviews & car news on the latest models. Find the right
Rental Car for you - get short term rental, long term lease, private hire cars, wedding cars te cars for p-plate probation drivers. Visit cur partner sites for job
openings for Singapare jobs, real estabe, mover, car performance parts, car discussion, farum discussion, commerdial vehicle leasing & COE results,

E 2004-2020 sgCarMart. All rights reserved,

https:/iwww.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/search_result_pricelist_print php?SA=AMOD=Chevrolst Orlando&RPG=20&VEH=04RGD=20138AVL=2
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Celine chE (LKKAuto)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 25 August 2020 6:28 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Ce: LKK Valuation

Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Hi Celine,

Please proceed to submit your valuation report.
Thanks.

Audrey Goh
DBS Bank

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 24 August 2020 2:15 PM

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

This mail originated from an external party outside DBS - celinefong@lkkauto.com.
Do not click on links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicle as below:

1) SKI507Y MV: 36K FS: 534 9K

As at August 2020

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 10:07 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,



Flease provide valuation for the below vehicle:-

1) SKJ507Y—Chevrolet Orlando 1.8A 5DR, road tax expired 5 Aug 2020,
Copy of vehicle registration details had been faxed.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh
DBS Bank Ltd
Tel - 6878 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and delete the mail. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sender and delete the mail. Thank you.




Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
—— B ==Ll B e = —— =1

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 August 2020 2:15 PM

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Cc: LKK Valuation

Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Dear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicle as below:

1} 5K) 507Y MV: 536K FS: 534.9K

As at August 2020

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 10:07 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com=; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Ce: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Valuation Request
Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Please provide valuation for the below vehicle:-
1) SKI507Y - Chevrolet Orlando 1.8A SDR, road tax expired 5 Aug 2020.
Copy of vehicle registration details had been faxed.

Thank you.

Audrey Goh
DBS Bank Ltd
Tel — 6878 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
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