Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 August, 2020 1:37 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: YM 3267M / Our Ref: SKX 5368A (Date of
Accident: 14.08.2020) *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC20008767/ba3 [External Confidential]

Attachments: 21082020133315.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 20/20/20/VC00/023541

Dear Mei Kwan,
Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
e gz

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 6:58 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: YM 3267M / Our Ref: SKX 5368A (Date of Accident: 14.08.2020)
[External Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC20008767/ba3

Dear Gerald,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed TP video footage.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August, 2020 12:50 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: YM 3267M / Our Ref: SKX 5368A (Date of Accident: 14.08.2020)
[External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 9:58 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: YM 3267M / Our Ref: SKX 5368A (Date of Accident: 14.08.2020)
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Our ref: 20/20/20/VC00/023541

Dear Summer,

Please proceed to survey and revert on liability.

You may obtain the video footage from the workshop.
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555




We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 9:32 am

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: YM 3267M / Our Ref: SKX 5368A (Date of Accident: 14.08.2020)

Dear Sir

We refer to the above matter.

Please can you arrange to survey our client’s vehicle no. SKX 5368A?
Please advise officer-in-charge and confirm whether liability is in our client favour?
Supporting documents are enclosed for your reference.

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64596267



