Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August, 2020 1:33 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'SUR'

Cc: Hansel Ang; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: FW: Accident vehicle between our insured SLG2109D and your insured SJE6567Y on
18/08/2020 || C10007059

Attachments: SJE6567Y.pdf; SLG2109D.pdf

Hi Team,

We would like to arrange TP PRS for SLG2109D. TP chose Mr. Adrian Ling to survey this vehicle.

Workshop information:

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
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reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 11:57 AM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Hansel Ang <hansel.ang@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident vehicle between our insured SLG2109D and your insured SIE6567Y on 18/08/2020 | |
C10007059

Hi,
We would like to appoint Mr. Adrian Ling (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) as the single joint expert for this accident
case.

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Ace Auto Solution <aceautosolution@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 8:20 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Accident vehicle between our insured SLG2109D and your insured SIE6567Y on 18/08/2020

Dear Sir

We are instructed by Tan Bak Leong to notify you of a road traffic accident on 18/08/2020 at about 1910 at
Junction of Pasir Ris Drive 3 & Pasir Ris Drive 10 involving our client’s/customer’s vehicle registration
number SLG2109D and vehicle registration number SJE6567Y driven by you at the material time. A copy
of the Singapore accident statement/traffic police report filed is enclosed.



As a result of the accident, our client’s/customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed
to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether
you or your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply
from you within the stipulated timeline, our client/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further
reference to you.

We look forward in having a direct settlement and request that one of the following named survey
companies be appointed as the single joint expert as finalization/processing of the claims after
finalization are done promptly.

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi / Service Advisor

Ace Auto Solution

Hp : 9189 2617 / Fax : 6844 5185

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 (South Wing), S'pore 415933

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
claimant.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not
reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are
not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or
disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the
sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect
views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the
intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure
of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then
delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.



