
1

Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 10:13 AM
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Our ref: GBA8991H ; Your ref: SH8269Y ; Acc date: 14.08.2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/FCI20008701/Kda3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for our viewing. 

Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 19 August 2020 6:10 PM 
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 
Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A 
Subject: RE: Our ref: GBA8991H ; Your ref: SH8269Y ; Acc date: 14.08.2020 *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20008701/Kda3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo. 
 
Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Jia Le via email. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 
 

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, August 17, 2020 2:59 PM 
To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Caroline Cabrera <Caroline@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 
chewgoon@singnet.com.sg; Eric <eric@chewgoonmotor.com.sg> 
Subject: Our ref: GBA8991H ; Your ref: SH8269Y ; Acc date: 14.08.2020 
 
Dear Sir / Mdm, 
 
Vehicle GBA8991H is lying at our workshop we have to arrange surveyor.  
Could you provide us with a list of 10 surveyors name. 
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Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 
 
 


