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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 December 2020 3:05 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJY5301Z and GBK3950G on 16.08.2020 (Your Ref: 

CC4/AIG20008693/Ara3)

Attachments: 14122020143727.pdf

Dear Jaslin, 

 

Please find enclosed the signed release voucher, kindly proceed with the payment accordingly. 

 

 

Thank You 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

 

 

 

 

On Mon, Dec 14, 2020 at 2:28 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Thank you for acceptance. 

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 14 December 2020 12:00 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJY5301Z and GBK3950G on 16.08.2020 (Your Ref: CC4/AIG20008693/Ara3) 

  

Dear Jaslin, 

  

We refer to your email dated 14/12/2020. 

  

We are agreeable to accept the offer as follows: 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 14,980.00  

2. Loss of Rental (18 days x $100.00)  $ 1,800.00  

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee  $ 36.45  

4. Towing Fee   $ 160.00  

Total  $ 16,976.45  

  

Kindly proceed DV or payment accordingly. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 

  

Michelle 
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Hp: 9856 4815 

  

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  

  

  

On Mon, Dec 14, 2020 at 11:35 AM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SJY 5301Z 

LKK Ref: CC4/AIG20008693/Ara3                                                    Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 3950G AND SJY 5301Z ON 16.08.2020 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 14,980.00  

2. Loss of Rental (18 days x $100.00)   $ 1,800.00  

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee  $ 36.45  

4. Towing Fee   $ 160.00  

Total  $ 16,976.45  

Please confirm acceptance. 
  

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 30 November 2020 4:22 PM 

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Accident involving SJY5301Z and GBK3950G on 16.08.2020 (Your Ref: CC4/AIG20008693/Ada3) 

  

Dear Jia Le, 

  

We refer to the above matter, LOD emailed on 10/09/2020. 

  

Till date, we have yet to receive any reply or offer from your side. 

  

Please update the status and let us have your reply soon. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 

  

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

  

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  

On Fri, Nov 13, 2020 at 6:00 PM Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Jia Le, 

  

We refer to the above matter, LOD emailed on 10/09/2020. 

  

Till date, we have yet to receive any reply or offer from your side. 

  

Please update the status and let us have your reply soon. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 

  

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 
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8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  

On Thu, Oct 15, 2020 at 6:00 PM Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Jia Le, 

  

We refer to the above matter, LOD emailed on 10/09/2020. 

  

Till date, we have yet to receive any reply or offer from your side. 

  

Please update the status and let us have your reply soon. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 

  

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

  

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 

Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  

  

  

On Thu, Sep 10, 2020 at 6:30 PM Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Jia Le, 

  

Please refer to the attached LOD. 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Yours faithfully, 

  

Michelle 

Hp: 9856 4815 

  

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 

#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit, 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6341 6789 
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Fax: 6341 6778 

  

  


