Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 December 2020 11:16 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBH1775A ESTIMATE

Attachments: RE: Fotos of accident skl 711 m-Qur ref:627466
Hi Taufikh,

Woon Meng is chasing the finalize.

Kindly refer to the attached (Bryan reviewed), try to finalize with them on L/S basis.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 August 2020 9:57 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH1775A ESTIMATE

Hi Shirley,
Already ask them to repair lumpsum, but they say cannot get 2nd hand part, vehicle less then 3 years.

Regards
Taufikh

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 7:12 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBH1775A ESTIMATE

Hi Taufikh,

Can inform repairer to repair on L/S basis?

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 3:57 pm

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: GBH1775A ESTIMATE

Hi Shirley,
Attached estimate.

Regards
Taufikh
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