Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 December 2021 18:43

To: yeeauto pteltd

Subject: [FINAL REMINDER] RE: CB6873L (Nissan Urvan) Accident Involving CB6873L &

SHC7284R ON 13 AUG 2020

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to our offer dated 19/02/2021.
Please reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 September 2021 9:44 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: CB6873L (Nissan Urvan) Accident Involving CB6873L & SHC7284R ON 13 AUG 2020

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to our offer dated 19/02/2021.
Please reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters.

Thank You.



Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 July 2021 9:27 AM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: CB6873L (Nissan Urvan) Accident Involving CB6873L & SHC7284R ON 13 AUG 2020

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to our offer dated 19/02/2021.
Please reconsider and let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 19 February 2021 5:44 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: CB6873L (Nissan Urvan) Accident Involving CB6873L & SHC7284R ON 13 AUG 2020

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to the above matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, our principal propose the settlement at Global Sum
$$1,400.00 (all-in).

Please kindly let us have your acceptance.



Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, 15 November 2020 11:42 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: CB6873L (Nissan Urvan) Accident Involving CB6873L & SHC7284R ON 13 AUG 2020

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's video footage
for your easy reference.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client's claim in the above
matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we are prepared to
offer 50% to your client's claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,



Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 11:25 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: CB6873L (Nissan Urvan) Accident Involving CB6873L & SHC7284R ON 13 AUG 2020

Hi Madam,
We attached vehicle CB6873L GIA report, motor claim discharge, repair bill and LOD
Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang

Yee Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459




