Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 August, 2020 1:15 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna'; ‘assignments’; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: RE: GAIC REF: CLMOMV(C000003874 TO ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLE4488G

,CLAIMING GBJ2866D ACCIDENT ON 14-08-2020

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 August 2020 4:08 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: GAIC REF: CLMOMVC000003874 TO ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLE4488G ,CLAIMING GBJ2866D
ACCIDENT ON 14-08-2020

Hi team

Please conduct TP survey, our insured has not reported.

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com

Regards
Kelvyna Ngian Claims Division| P. +65 68046059 | F. +65 62353354 | kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com
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Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented time.
As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing the high
level of service you deserve. Read more.

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: 18 August 2020 9:46 AM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: GAIC REF: CLMOMVC000003874 TO ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLE4488G ,CLAIMING
GBJ2866D ACCIDENT ON 14-08-2020

Dear Kelvyna

Thank you for sending us SJE , we have decided to let LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd , to conduct the PRI for our client
vehicle .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: 17 August 2020 3:46 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] TO ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLE4488G ,CLAIMING GBJ2866D ACCIDENT ON 14-08-2020

Dear Motor Claims Dept.

Please arrange surveyor to survey our client vehicle SLE4488G for t. p. claim your insured vehicle GBJ2866D accident
on 14-08-2020, mean time kindly advise us the liability so direct settlement ,thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686
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immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.
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