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RE: SME8707L finalise
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I trust content from shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg. | Show blocked content

Tue 17/11/2020 4:52 PM

Dear Taufikh,
 
We accept the offer below and thanks for your prompt reply.
 
Thank you.
 
 
 
Best Regards,
Lee Shirley | Claims Advisor
 

T 6262 8888 | F 6250 9015 | M 8686 5188
Email: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg
MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.
160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02
Sin Ming Autocity • Singapore 575722
www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg
 
From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 11:22 AM 
To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)' <taufikh@lkkauto.com>; shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SME8707L finalise
 
Hi Shirley,
 
Our final offer, l/s$9050 , 7 days.
 
Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto
 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 1:28 PM 
To: 'shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg' 
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' 
Subject: RE: SME8707L finalise
 
Hi Shirley, 
 
Please refer a�ached,  COR l/s$8400, 7days.

S
shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

     

To:  Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Cc:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto)



RE: SME8707L finalise

shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg
<shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>
Tue 17/11/2020 4:52 PM
To:  Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
<denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Dear Taufikh,
 
We accept the offer below and thanks for
your prompt reply.
 
Thank you.
 
 
 
Best Regards,
Lee Shirley | Claims Advisor
 

T 6262 8888 | F 6250 9015 | M 8686 5188
Email: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg
MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.
160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02
Sin Ming Autocity • Singapore 575722
www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg
 
From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)
<taufikh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 November 2020 11:22 AM 
To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'
<taufikh@lkkauto.com>;
shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'
<denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SME8707L finalise
 
Hi Shirley,
 
Our final offer, l/s$9050 , 7 days.
 
Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto
 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)
[mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 12 November 2020 1:28 PM 
To: 'shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg' 

 Print  Cancel
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