Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 7 December 2020 11:49 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Claims

Subject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND
SHC5771P ON 12/08/2020] *** LKK REF : CC3/CTI120008649/Kra3

Attachments: AAD2008-047 - DV.pdf

Without prejudice

Dear Jaslin
Attach duly signed DV for your action.
Hope to receive your payment soon.

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original
signature copy of the Documents.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 7 December, 2020 8:45 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020] =*x LKK REF : CC3/CTI20008649/Kra3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Discharge Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action:

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 December 2020 9:18 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020] #*x LKK REF : CC3/CTI20008649/Kra3

Without prejudice

Dear Jaslin
Please proceed to send us the DV.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 3 December, 2020 1:55 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subiject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020] =+ LKK REF : CC3/CTI20008649/Kra3




Your Ref: SHC 5771P

LKK Ref: CC3/CTI20008649/Kra3 Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME 5650K & SHC 5771P ON 12/08/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,551.50
2. Loss of Rental (2.5 days x $81.13) (w/GST) $202.83
3. Loss of Use (2.5 days x $50.00) $ 125.00
4. LTA Search Fee $7.49
Total | $ 1,886.82

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 November 2020 4:49 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jasmine Tan; Claims

Subject: FW: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020]

Without prejudice

Dear Jia Le

As spoken, Rear Left tyre Rim should under “PART” item portion.

As such, amount confirmed $1,450 (before GST).

Enclosed is amended LOD + invoice for your action.

Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claims.

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original
signature copy of the documents.



Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Wai Yin Ng [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 19 November, 2020 1:17 PM

To: 'Jia Le (LKK Auto)’ <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020]

Without prejudice

Dear Jia Le
Due to this case no “PART” given. As such, no need to deduct 20% on total.

We are maintain our COR amount at $1,815.00(before GST).



AAD2008-047

SHCSTTIP - DOA 12.08.20

PART 5 =

S.NETT 5 60.00
5 380.00

5 440,00

LABOUR 5 &00.00
5 60.00
5 20.00
3 15.00
5 £30.00
5 1,375.00
L3 1,815.00 *due to no "PART" portion this case should not be -20%
FINAL s 1,815.00
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November, 2020 11:46 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subiject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020]




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wai Yin,
Our surveyor finalized repair cost at $1,450.00. Kindly assist to check and amend the invoice.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November 2020 11:38 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jasmine Tan; Claims

Subject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020]

Without prejudice

Dear Jia Le
As your requested.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct
of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764



From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 November, 2020 9:21 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subiject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wai Yin,
Kindly let us have a copy of LOD for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 2 November 2020 9:56 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jasmine Tan; Claims

Subject: RE: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON
12/08/2020]

Without prejudice

Dear Jia Le
Attached video footage for your investigation.

Our taxi was travelling straight on his lane, your client who suddenly drive out from the side road from the left without
checking for the oncoming vehicle and collided onto our taxi left side portion.

Circumstances of Accident

OM 12/08/2020 AT 0850HRS | WAS TRAVELLING STRAIGHT ALONG SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 5. | SUDDENL'
AN IMPACT ON THE LEFT SIDE OF MY TAXI. VEHICLE B(SME5650K) HAS CAME OUT OF THE SIDE ROAD ON MY
WITHOUT CHECKING FOR ON-COMING VEHICLES AND COLLIDED ONTO MY TAXI'S LEFT SIDE PORTION.
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Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** plegse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 30 October, 2020 1:59 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Your ref: AAD2008-047 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SME5650K AND SHC5771P ON 12/08/2020]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for viewing.
Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



