8/25/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SML8864D & SLF9359H ACCIDENT ON 14.08.2020 ALONG
RIVER VALLEY ROAD

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Tue 8/25/2020 3:10 PM

To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above

mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair
to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.
And the days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted via email.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2020 11:17 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SML8864D & SLF9359H ACCIDENT ON 14.08.2020 ALONG RIVER VALLEY
ROAD

Dear Asher,
I would like to check liability clearance of this case.
Kenneth had surveyed the vehicle yesterday.

Thank you.

Regards
Angela Tan
Motor claims Executive
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Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg
Phone: +65 9644 3110
60, Jalan Lam Huat #07-43, Carros Centre, Singapore 737869

/N NA

From: Angela Tan

Sent: Tuesday, 18 August 2020 9:56 AM

To: AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com

Subject: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SML8864D & SLF9359H ACCIDENT ON 14.08.2020 ALONG RIVER VALLEY ROAD

To: AIG Accident Claims Dept. (Arrangement of Surveyor Unit)

RE: NOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURERS TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKINGS DAY
PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH PHOTOCOL FOR NIN-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA) ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SML8864D & SLF9359H ALONG RIVER VALLEY ROAD ON 14.08.2020.

We are repairer for BIS MOTORING PTE LTD the owner of vehicle no SML8864D.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can inspected at the following venue:

Munich Autocare Pte Ltd
60 Jalan Lam Huat #07-43 Singapore 737869
Mobile No: 96443110 Email: angela.tan@miunichautocare.com.sg

Contact Person: Angela Tan

Please also provide us a list of 10 surveyors as your nominated SJE (Single Joint Expert)

Regards
Angela Tan

Motor claims Executive

Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg

Phone: +65 9644 3110

60, Jalan Lam Huat #07-43, Carros Centre, Singapore 737869

/N NA
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