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[REVISED MANDATE GIVEN] [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A &
SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL

Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Mon 6/28/2021 10:02 AM

To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

3 attachments (1 MB)

10062021175545.pdf; EMAIL FROM TP REPAIRER DD 10.06.2021.pdf; RPT.PDF;

Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
Please be informed that you have our revised mandate to settle the matter from $33,315.49 - $38,115.49 (all
in).
 
Kindly start to offer LOU @ $80 - $120 x 90 - 100 Days.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on
Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We
have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.
 
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 7:18 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL:
D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Vic
 

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
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Kindly refer to attached workshop email.
 

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 12:01 PM

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL:
D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Vic
 
Kindly refer to TP answer below:
 
Most of the parts were not available in Singapore and many of the major items needed to be manufactured
and delivered to Singapore which took a period of 3 months plus.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 10:16 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer further to your below email and to the revised mandate request.

mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
mailto:VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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We noted that the TP repairer had requested for more days for the LOU in view of parts being ordered and to
be delivered.
 
As such, we would like to seek your advise on the below queries:
 

1. Are the parts available from any other supplier for this type of vehicle? Did the repairer requested from
more than 1 supplier on these parts, rather than wait for the particular supplier for the parts to arrive
for a long time. As it is only fair that TP should also mitigate their loss.

2. Please confirm, before the new parts arrived, is the TP vehicle drivable? Or any possibility that the TP
vehicle can continue to be driven while waiting for the replacement parts?

 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on
Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We
have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.
 
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 12:53 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Vic
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $ 40,515.49

 

The summary is as follows: -

 



Amount Claimed Amount Revised

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 71,486.10 $ 25,680.00 ($24,000.00 +7%GST)

2. Loss of Use (120 days x $120.00) $ 14,400.00 $ 14,400.00 (120 days x $120.00)

3. Towing Fees $ 428.00 $ 428.00

4. LTA Report fee $ 7.49 $ 7.49

Total $ 86,321.59 $ 40,515.49

 

Surveyor recommended 20 days for repair + 100 days (waiting for parts) = 120 days

 

DATE DAY DESCRIPTION NO OF DAYS
13/8/2020 THU PRS 1
14/8/2020 FRI PRS 1
15/8/2020 SAT R1 1
16/8/2020 SUN NON WORKING DAY 1
17/8/2020 MON R2 1
18/8/2020 TUE R3 1
19/8/2020 WED R4 1
20/8/2020 THU R5 1
21/8/2020 FRI R6 1
22/8/2020 SAT R7 1
23/8/2020 SUN ORDER PARTS 1
24/8/2020 - 31/8/2020 WAITING FOR PARTS 8
1/9/2020 - 30/9/2020 WAITING FOR PARTS 30
1/10/2020 -
31/10/2020 WAITING FOR PARTS 31
1/11/2020 -
30/11/2020 WAITING FOR PARTS 30
1/12/2020 TUE R8 1
2/12/2020 WED R9 1
3/12/2020 THU R10 1
4/12/2020 FRI R11 1
5/12/2020 SAT R12 1
6/12/2020 SUN NON WORKING DAY 1
7/12/2020 MON R13 1
8/12/2020 TUE R14 1
9/12/2020 WED R15 1
10/12/2020 THU R16 1
11/12/2020 FRI R17 1
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, May 31, 2021 12:29 PM

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 1088E (FCI) AND SLD 48A (TP) ON 11/08/2020
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $ 40,515.49
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 71,486.10 $ 25,680.00 ($24,000.00 +7%GST)
2. Loss of Use (120 days x $120.00) $ 14,400.00 $ 14,400.00 (120 days x $120.00)
3. Towing Fees $ 428.00 $ 428.00
4. LTA Report fee $ 7.49 $ 7.49

Total $ 86,321.59 $ 40,515.49
 
Surveyor recommended 20 days for repair + 100 days (waiting for parts) = 120 days
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, May 28, 2021 3:26 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL

mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
Please be informed that you have our mandate to settle the matter from $28,195.49 - $29,235.49 (all in).
 
Kindly start to offer LOU @ $80 x 26 Days.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on
Work From Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We
have access to e-mails and will work to respond in a timely manner.
 
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.
 
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan 

Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021 2:18 pm

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL:
D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer to your bellow email and the contents were noted.
 
We will get back to you for an update/instruction the soonest time.
 
Please informed TP to hold hands on the matter.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From
Home arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and
will work to respond in a timely manner.
 
We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021 2:04 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 1088E (FCI) AND SLD 48A (TP) ON 11/08/2020
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $ 29,235.49
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 71,486.10 $ 25,680.00 ($24,000.00 +7%GST)
2. Loss of Use (120 days x $120.00) $ 14,400.00 $ 3,120.00 (26 days x $120.00)
3. Towing Fees $ 428.00 $ 428.00
4. LTA Report fee $ 7.49 $ 7.49

Total $ 14,291.38 $ 29,235.49
 
Surveyor recommended 20 days for repair + 4 Sunday + 2 PRS = 26 days
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
 

13/8/2020 THU PRS 1
14/8/2020 FRI PRS 2
15/8/2020 SAT R1 3

16/8/2020 SUN
NON NORKING
DAY 4

17/8/2020 MON R2 5
18/8/2020 TUE R3 6
19/8/2020 WED R4 7

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
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20/8/2020 THU R5 8
21/8/2020 FRI R6 9
22/8/2020 SAT R7 10

23/8/2020 SUN
NON NORKING
DAY 11

24/8/2020 MON R8 12
25/8/2020 TUE R9 13
26/8/2020 WED R10 14
27/8/2020 THU R11 15
28/8/2020 FRI R12 16
29/8/2020 SAT R13 17

30/8/2020 SUN
NON NORKING
DAY 18

31/8/2020 MON R14 19
1/9/2020 TUE R15 20
2/9/2020 WED R16 21
3/9/2020 THU R17 22
4/9/2020 FRI R18 23
5/9/2020 SAT R19 24

6/9/2020 SUN
NON NORKING
DAY 25

7/9/2020 MON R20 26
 
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 4:23 PM
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
Noted with thanks.
 
Please assist to expedite.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
mailto:VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
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Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 4:20 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Vic
 
Please be informed that we are currently preparing our report to seek mandate.
 
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 4:18 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
Kindly advise on the status of this matter.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com
mailto:VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 10:22 am

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan
<VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
Dear Vic / Rachel
 
We will prepare our report to seek mandate.
 
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 10:09 AM

To: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan
<VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21 MSFCIL: D20003195MFSH/CTPL
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Dear Suann,
 
LKK will reply you on the offer.
 
 
Dear LKK,
 
Below email fyna.
Please be advised that OIC for this matter is Vic.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards
 
Rachel Wu
Motor Claim Dept
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507
3862
|  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
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7/15/2021 Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQkAGY5MjA5NjAxLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA2OQAQAMJw76U%2F%2BkZCtYzQ%2F… 11/11

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2021 10:01 AM

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; motor_claims@msfirst-insurance.com.sg

Subject: SLD48A & SHC1088E on 11/8/21
 
Dear Rachel
 
Your ref : CC4/FCI20008474/R1da3
 
Enclosed is our letter of demand for your attention & action.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards

Suanne Chiu

Claims Asst.Manager

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: +65 6272 3892
Fax: +65 6270 8314
 

 

Connect with us on 
 
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for

delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and

kindly notify the sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not

be deemed as unless otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message.
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