Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 20 July 2020 7:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); assignments; Admin A

Subject: FW: MCT19120276 Yrref : DP.sl.11196.20. TIMC PI

Attachments: mct19120276 priya_20200720103950.pdf; mct19120276 priya_20200720103858.pdf;

mct19120276 priya_20200720103806.pdf; mct19120276 priya_20200720103715.pdf

From: Mekavathanan Sarangapani

Sent: Monday, 20 July 2020 6:59:50 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: KKLau; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Derrick Tan; Manivel Priyadarshini; Zuhaidah Samsuri; Dhanya B.Purushothaman; Sherini Pillai
Subject: FW: MCT19120276 Yr ref : DP.sl.11196.20. TIMC PI

Non ARC.
Paper survey please
Liability — DO we have the CCTV footage and have we viewed the same yet ?

Meka



REFEREMCE

Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid Policy Mo
Claimant Vehicle No : FBGS5659U Insured
Date of Loss: 11/12/2019 MNature of

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: FBG5689U

IMake & Model: YAMAHA FZ16, 153cc (M)
Req. Date: 03/09/2012 (Man. Year: 2012)
Colour: White

Engine Capacity: 153 cc

Iarket Value/New Car Price: MIA

Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

Zanaral Tandition: Eair Ctoorina (Qanvicaahla’y-

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Insured: -, Co. Reg. No.: -

Main Claimant: =

Vehicle Reg. No.: FBG5689U Date ¢

; Paoli

Claim Type: TP / MCT19120276 een

WVehicle Reg. No. Policy

{Insured}: Gt (Claim
Excess

Repairer: Tune In Motor. Com (HQ) Blk 1016 #01-214 Yishun Industrial Park A, 768758 Yishi

Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Priya]

Adjuster: 'LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-2561 ... [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] ... [

Init. Est. Repair =

Costs: 5,000 - 6,000

From: Mekavathanan Sarangapani

Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 11:13 AM

To: Daniel Poon & Co. (law@dpco.com.sg) <law@dpco.com.sg>

Cc: Manivel Priyadarshini <manivel@iii.com.sg>; Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iii.com.sg>; Dhanya B.Purushothaman
<Dhanya@iii.com.sg>; Sherini Pillai <sherini@iii.com.sg>; Derrick Tan <DerrickTan@iii.com.sg>

Subject: FW: MCT19120276 Yr ref : DP.s1.11196.20. TIMC PI

Dear Sirs,

MAHADHIR BIN AHMAD, NRIC# 5§ XXXX040/E
ACCIDENT ON 11 DECEMBER 2019 INVOLVING FB(
ALONG TPE BEFORE EXIT 3A TOWARDS PUNGGOL

We are in receipt of your letter of demand which is receiving our attention.



We shall revert to your shortly. Kindly note that we are preserving our rights to conduct a medical re-
examination on your client, re-inspection/inspection of your damage vehicle or property ( whichever is relevant)
where necessary.

In the meanwhile, if your client is claiming for injuries and is considering claiming for paid wages, please provide a
letter from his/her employers confirming the following :

1. Aletter from your client’s employers confirming that your client was paid wages/ salaries during his/her
medical leave period and they did not indemnify him/her medical expenses if he/ she is claiming for injuries ;
2. Medical Certificate (s) showing that your client was on medical leave as claimed if he/she is claiming
for injuries
3. That your client has made a WICA claim under Ministry of Manpower if he/she is claiming for injuries

Please refrain from forwarding physical copies to us via mail, as we only accept soft copies of the same.

Please ensure you forward a copy of your client’s Warrant To Act for our perusal and retention

For all future cases, please direct all your LODs to us via email at lod@iii.com.sg.

Also for ease of reference we have included the names and email addresses of our Colleagues . Our files/cases are
handled based on the suffix of our insured vehicle. You can write to our Colleagues directly (based on
the appended list) and you must copy our HOD, Head of Claims, Mr Mekavathanan at Mekavathanan@ii.com.sg

Name of Officer | Initials Email Address Suffix
Aida ZS aida@iii.com.sg 1
Sherini SP sherini@iii.com.sg 2
Sundari SN sundari@iii.com.sg 3
Dhanya BP dhanya@iii.com.sg 4
Priya MP manivel@iii.com.sg 5
Gabriel WH gabriel@iii.com.sg 6
Derrick DT derricktan@iii.com.sg 7
Derrick DT derricktan@iii.com.sg 8
Meenachi CM meenachi@iii.com.sg 9
Lalitha KL lalitha@iii.com.sg 0

Best Regards

SYSTEM GENERATED DOCUMENT REQUIRE NO SIGNATURE

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any
use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as
information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability



for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of
Internet transmission or any modification.



