Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 June 2021 9:58 AM

To: simon@kkimhin.com.sg; sandrakhong@gmail.com; 'KKH'

Subject: RE: SJU 6663T DOA 11/08/2020 CHIAN TAI PING FINALISATION AND AFTER REPAIR
PHOTOS

Hi,

P/P $1315.15 confirm, 3days

Submit your documents directly to China TaiPing

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 6:40 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; sandrakhong@gmail.com; 'KKH' <service@kkimhin.com.sg>;
Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJU 6663T DOA 11/08/2020 CHIAN TAI PING FINALISATION AND AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS

Dear Kenneth,

Enclosed for your attention.
P/P $1315.15

03 repair days

Please check and reply.

Regards
Simon

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 5:12 PM

To: Simon <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>; sandrakhong@gmail.com; KKH <service@kkimhin.com.sg>
Subject: SJU 6663T DOA 11/08/2020 CHIAN TAI PING

Hi,



Can update on the repair status? can finalise? please forward if it's ready

Thanks and regards,

Denise

Case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 7 62563561 Fax: &£ 6256 4315
Email: [=7 sur@lkkauto.com




