Auto

Consultants

Pte Ltd

Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 UBI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 27/01/2021

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicle N SMA 3675Z (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM20HO01128-JG
ehicle No.
SMA 7122B (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI20008419/R1ga3q2

Date of Accident 5/8/2020
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost $ 9,891.62
Loss of Use ' $ days
Rental (If any) :$ 856.00 8 days
Others: ' $

$

10,747.62

Final Settlement Sum ' 9 10,747.62
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

' $ 10,747.62

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 December 2020 9:17 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jess Francis Carlos; Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jessica Harry Shastri

Subject: RE: Check items / EQ ref - SMA3675Z / Our ref - SMA7122B / Doa Aug 5, 2020
(DM20HO01128-JG) *** LKK REF: CC4/EQI20008419/ga3 LOD

Attachments: 1039_001.pdf

Dear Cecilia,

The repairs have been completed for SMA7122B. We submit the following claims with supporting
your perusal:—

documents for

1)

Invoice No. 30015954

$9,891.62

2)

Loss of Rental (Invoice # 22658)

$856.00

3)

LTA/GIA Search Fees

4)

Letter of Authorization

5)

Discharge Voucher

Please pay $9,891.62 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd,
$856.00 to Eurokars Leasing Pte Ltd

$10,747.62

We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon.

Regards,
JEN LIM

Insurance Claims Admin
TEL: 6331 0698

27A, Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto. com>
Sent: 04 December 2020 2:17 PM

To: Jess Francis Carlos <jess. carlos@eurokars. com. sg>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald. yap@eurokars. com. sg>
Subject: RE: Check items / EQ ref — SMA3675Z / Our ref — SMA7122B / Doa Aug 5, 2020 (DM20HO01128-JG) sk
LKK REF: CC4/EQ120008419/ga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jess,

For cost of repair, the recommended repair cost as calculated is P/P $9244.50 (bef GST) with 7 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD and other documents to me.

*Please note that the repair cost and days are subjected to our principal’s approval.*

Thanks



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

In the matter of an E}c‘)jdent involving motor vehicles SMmA I ﬂgand SMA 3675Z / OTHERS
on &KW W TN o~ JeLspUt TWAhD oD
Bueat  pesmib— howp
v i SMHA VTR

e, trCcg PENTAL- [ V= the owner of vehicle registration number
at the matenal time of accident hereby appoint Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd to proceed with the repairs
BUMaM MsinugLo LOUOGU W HIYIUUL VEITHIVIG 1T UIe dUove  declgent in accordance with the

recommendations and advice of the licensed motor surveyor appointed by the insurers or on
my/our behalf.

IAWe authorise Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd and/or its representative to submit and make any claims
which l/we may have against the other party/parties or alternatively under the insurance policy
taken up by me/us in respect of the cost of repairs suffered by mefus arising from the accident,
ana o receive payment (such payment to be made by way of cheque in favour of Trans Eurokars
Pte Ltd) due to me/us in connection with and arising out of the above claim.

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd and/or its representative are herebv aiitharised ac mv aftamay ta avarcita
and/or sign any documents/discharge vouchers regarding the above claim.

I/We further confirm that the acceptance by Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd of the settiement amount in
respect of such claim shall constitute the full discharae of mv/aur claim in respect of such loss and

I/'We hereby declare that all acts and documents done bv virtue of this | etter of Authorisation on
my/our behalf shall be good valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if the
same had been done or executed by me/us in person.

Datedthe 18 dayof 08 509 b

Owner Name and Signature itrfes¥ Na y@ and Signaturé
NRIC No.: Rl

ES.022019v1



ID:BO5

I

MaGoBE:

CUSTOMER:
ADDRESS :

TEL NO:
MODEL:
CHASSIS NO:
ENGINE NO:
DESCRIPTION:

MZ—BHT

MZ-SP-
MZ-BR-

MZ-BRA
MZ~—-BR-
MZ-BR-

TAIX TIHNVOICEK

lo:M90364005A
—— e — _ —_— ——— (TP¥Xr)

PAGE NO : 1
EQ00Q0Q4 INS-EQI INVOICE NO: E 30015¢

DEPT/POS ID: T f A2
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD DATE IN . 21/09/202¢
5 Maxwell Ro ; DATE PRINTED: 08/12/202(
#17-00 Tower JOB NO ¢+ leB4o
MND Complex CSO/0OP CODE: Jenny Lim
6223 29433 REGN NO X SMAT712Z2B
MAZDA3 1.5L HB DELUXE BLACK LS REGN DATE : 1B/06/201¢
JMGEBNZ24A8J0214793 MILEAGE
P520504518 REQUISITIOM

Body repair

T SUTITIN S TS ET R T ETH

AT THTRAMT MATE - Nne /t
FKR  KEPLACH FRI BUMPER. KEPAIR TUP-GRLLLE
SF SPRAY FRT BUMPER, TOP-GRIIL
RE REPLACE REAR BUMPER. REPAI

AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENTI
RE TO TRANSFER REVERSE SENSOF
PLL TO SUPPLY NUMBER PLATE.
EL TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNC

MZ-BR-+RE TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR V¥

MZ-BR+
MZ-SP4

nwLohWwC

All major repaired parts stated above are covered under a 6 months or 10,000 km warranty,
whichever comes first. The above excludes expendable maintenance items, natural wear

SU SUNDRIES
SR SPRAY TATTL.GATE & REAR BUMPER._

~UoLDDD [R1 DUMEDLIN DN WU/ EL LA DRDEC
-0Z5 GROMMET , SCREW 2.0 it
~-146A FASTENER 2.0 =
-2G2 SEAL, RUBBER BN 2.0 2.4
-833 RTVET.SPT.ASH SHTELD s~ AN 6 A=k

& tear components and parts damaged due to negligence or improper handlings.

Proof of Payment is only valid if this invoice is stamped "PAID" & signed by us. Any dispute
to this invoice must be made within 5 calendar days.

CASH / NETS / AMEX / VIS v/ 1ew sorin

bbU. UU|
30.00
30.00

30.00
70.00
50.00
30.00
10.00
50.00
5.80
5.80
5.00
1.80
5.20
5.50

IRAND LURUKARS PILE LID

NO:
iture Authoriged Signatur
Corporate Head Office :  Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd, Eurokars Centre 12 Sungei Kadut Ave Singapore 729648 ﬁ
Showrooms & Service Centres : : turokarsl mtersal_es Leptre H
ZORRTIZOOT, GHCATEmaE, . i | DU e | ENEimceppes i

T Service Fax: 6476 7417 Service Fax: 6331 0620



ID:BO5 TAaS ITINVOICE

{0:M20364005A
v —_——————— — —_— _ ,e,ee———e—e——— {TP)
th=ﬂ) PAGE NO : 2
MaCE0aEs : EO004 INS-EQI INVOICE NO: I 30015¢
DEPT/POS ID: r £ 12
CUSTOMER: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD DATE IN 21/08/202(
5 Maxwell Ro DATE PRINTED: 08/12/202(
#17-00 Tower JOB NO : léB4S
MND Complex CSO/OP CODE: Jenny Lim
6223 9433 REGN NO : SMA7122B
MUDEL : MAZDA3 1.5L HB DBELUAEL BLACK LS REGN DATE : 18/06/201¢
CHASSIS NO: JMEBN24A8J0214723 * MILEAGE
ENGINE NO: P520504518 REQUISITION
DESCRIPTION: Body repair
CODE
ST L3
~a GT._F-;I_‘E!R'
oy—-u31t RLIVEL 4.0 B.L £2.00
5(0-2G2 SEAL, RUBBER BN 2.0 £k 3.60
50-7K1A MOULD LHF RAD.GRILLB 1.0  191.E L.50
50-7J1A MOULD RHF RAD GRILL abe(e i B T ] E.70
51-730 MASCOT, FRT BN/DK 1.0 /1 F | =)
50-716 BRACKET, RA BN L.70
50-033A27 GRILLE-UP RADIATOR B 5.40
50-355 RIVET 5.80
51-833 RIVET, SPLASH SHIELD 5.00
5(0-EAl FASTE 5.60
5(0—-221ABB REAR 1.50
5(0-0Z1A GROMM J.80
5(-355 RIVET .00
5¢-145 CLIP 5.80
5¢-146A FASTE 5.00
V_U'lll(.'l'll!\"lﬂ COmes nmsL. .I ne dUl:I\"C CKLIE]L!CQ Elperll..l.dule |'"|"I“?l|!llﬂ“£c l_l.!mﬁ_!_"dluldl wedr TRANS EU RO I(ARS PTE LTD
& tear COMPONENTs and parts damaged due 1o negiigence or IMproper hanalngs.
Proof of Payment is only valid if this invoice is stamped “PAID" & signed by us. Any dispute
to this invoice must be made within 5 calendar days.
CASH / NFTR / AMEX /IS, oy e
N
Customer Signature Authorﬁed Signatui
D TRANS ELRE)IF(“A_I!S Corporate Head Office : I@nuw 05 Fax: 6369 3005 uKN_"1‘2‘ .‘:‘;L_Jr]g_e_l_@dut Ave Singapore 729648
= Showrooms & Service Centres : Eurokirs Aftersales Centre :
ZOOITI-ZOONNT Gt 6395 aa5s — SemiceTel: 63958899 Sales Tols 6603 6115 Semice Teh: 66036128 Saice Telogams 0606 - P4

T Service Fax: 6476 7417 Service Fax: 6331 0620



TAI INVOICE

owv

80
10
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00
00
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40
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60
30
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70

) GST Reg No:MS0364005A
l“ - : I o A D i Lt e W - \_ S E)
kl,-) PAGE NO 3
[T =r2 e =HH E00Q04 INS-EQI INVOICE NO: I 30015954
DEPT/POS ID: L f 12
CUSTOMER: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD DATE IN : 21/09/2020
ADDRESS: 5 Maxwell Road DATE PRINTED: 0B/12/2020
#17-00 Tower Block JOB NO : 16849
MND Complex CSO/0OP CODE: Jenny Lim
TEL NO: 6223 9433 REGN NO SMAT7122B
MODRET. = MAZNAR 1_RT. HR NRETLIIXFT RT.ACK T.8 REGN DATE 1R/0&/2018
CHASSIS NO: JMG6BN24A8J021
ENGINE NO: P520504518
DESCRIPTION: Body repair
DESCRIPTION
—EM1A TAPE, P
DU _ELl BB COVER{J—I} r LAV IIhh .V IL 4 =W J_J-UUI 4L e
—EK1 BB COVER(R),TOW HK CVR 1.0 15 . 15 .
—7 2% RR ORNAMENT BM 5DR L 56. 56.
i i 2 D ORNAMENT SKYACTIVE B 1.0 66. 66.
-163 GASKET (L) , RR.COMB BM 150 225 22
aae e —a—153 GASKET (R) , RR.COMB. EM 150 22. 22%
BHNS-51-730 MASCOT REAR M3 5DR nfstilo 78, 78.
B61K-5(}-070A REINF., FRT BUMPER BN 1.0 502. Q2.
BE63E-5()-1COA PLATE, SET BN 1.0 70 T .
B63C-5()—-164 BRACKET LHF BN 1.0 12 12.
DOSL—DY—1D4 DRAUKIL KOE DN &t 1&. 12
BABD-5(-170 HOLDER, LICENSE PLATE 1.0 4. 74.
B63B-5(}-163 BRACKET (L), FRT BUMPE 1+ 0 e T
B63B-5(-153 BRACKET (R) , FRT BUMPE A0 il 2l
B63B-5(-B51 PROTECTOR, (L) BN 1.0 38. It
39.

ajor repaired Farts stated above are covered under a 6 months or 10,000 km warranty,
hever comes first. The above excludes expendable maintenance items, natural wear
& tear components and parts damaged due to negligence or improper handlings.

Proof of Payment is only valid if this invoice is stamped “PAID" & signed by us. Any dispute
to this involce must be imade within 5 calendar days.

CASH / NETS / AMEX / VISA / MAST
MM

LUrpordie neda wimce ITelNs CUMORGES FLE LU, CUrGRAns WENeE 1L JUNEEl Radul AYE JINEAPOTE 7 470490
Tel: 6363 3003 Fax: 6369 3003 BRN.199103859N

Showrooms & Service Centres :

5 Ubi Close Singapore 408605

Sales Tel.: 6395 8888  Service Tel.: 6395 8899

Service Fax: 6744 9402

® TRANSELROKARS

Bwokars Group

WHTI-Z 77 23 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159095

Sales Tel.: 6603 6118 Service Tel.: 6603 6128
Sales Fax: 6476 7073

v

Eurokars Aftersales Centre :
27A Tanjong Penjuru Singapore 60
Service Tel.: 6331 0606

10

IRAND EURUKARD PIE LID



ID:BO5 TARIX ITHNVOICE

zS GST Reg No:M30364005A
L 'Y s S oy — e N LA O S XS AVIAER . C AT \‘.l.'.l:-')
g PAGE NO = 4
NSfo8Ee : E0004 INS-EQI INVOICE NO: T 30015¢
DEPT/POS 1ID: L F A2
CUSTOMER: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD DATE IN . 21/09/202¢
5 Maxwell Ro ; DATE PRINTED: 08/12/202(
#17-00 Tower JOB NO : 16849
MND Complex CS0O/OP CODE: Jenny Lim
6223 9433 REGN NO : SMAT7122B
MODEL: MAZDA3 1.5L HB DELUXE BLACK LS REGN DATE : 18/06/201¢
CHASSIS NO: JMEBN24ABJ0Z2 MILEAGE
ENGINE NO: P520504518 REQUISITIOM

DESCRIPTION: Body repair

DOJU_DH_DUJ. /Lot LIS, (L) DN L= Q:-J.UI o - RPN LW )
5(0-B41 PROTECTOR RH GRILL B 1.0 39.C 3.00
5(¢-B31 PROTECTOR, GRILLE BN 1.0 b a1 L.00
5(0-B31 PROTECTOR, GRILLE BN 1.0 7daled L. 00
5(0-B31 PROTECTOR, FRT MOULD B 50 ¢ ©9.7 3.70
50-B51B PROTECTOR RHF BUMPER 130 208 J.50
50-B41B PROTECTOR LHF BUMPER 1.0 2008 J.50
5(0-260 REINF RR BUMPE BM/BN 1.0 564.: 1.20

| | Surcharae 0.00 ol W 647 9%
:a 9,89]
.d (
apt Due 9,891

TRANS EUROKARS PTELID

WWINLITEVET COITIES 3L 11T JDUVE CALIVUTS 18 duie rmaiy T Iems, nalural yweai
& T2ar COMPONENTs angd Parts damagea aue to NegUEence or IMproper Nananngs.

Proof of Payment is only valid if this invoice is stamped “PAID" & signed by us. Any dispute
to this invoice must be made within 5 calendar days.

CASH / NFTS / ANEY /\/IS

EAWANA LR LY AN W

Authogised Signatu

2 12 Sungei Kadut Ave Singapore 729648 1l

v~ 6363 3003 Fax: 6369 3003 BRN.199103859N |
Showrooms & Service Centres : Euraf(nn Aftersales Centre :
77— 77 - M I BT T 2o weng o Road Singapore 159095 27A Tanjonp, Penjuru Singapore 609[)+
TOC 200, Sales Tel.: 6395 8888  Service Tel.: 6395 8899 Sales Tel.: 6603 6118  Service Tel.: 6603 6128 Service Tel.: 6331 0606 91
Service Fax: 6744 9402 Sales Fax: 6476 7073 Service Fax: 6476 7417 Service Fax: 6331 0620

wrokan Ltoup



BKW

RENT-A-CAR

TAX INVOICE

GST REG. NO.. 200106276D

INVOICE TO. DATE INVOICE NO.
EUROKARS LEASING PTE LTD 05-0ct-2020 P 3407
274
TANJONG PENJURU
SINGAPORE 609042
ATTN: MARNI

VHA NO. DUE DATE VEH NO.
P 3407 05-0ct2020 | SLM5197Y
DESCRIPTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOQUNT
RENTAL FROM 21 SEPTEMBER 2020 TO 29 SEPTEMBER 2020 o @0 @
YOUR REF: SMA 7122 B
GST@ 7% @
TOTAL ‘@

All cheques must be made payable to BKW Rent A Car Pte Ltd,
Please write the vehicle and invoice number on the reserve,

BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd
120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre (S) 169208 Tel: 6738 7777 Fax: 6738 6666

ACRA No: 2001062760 GST Req. No: 20-0106276-1  Website: www.bkw.sg
A subsidiary of BKW Automobile Pte Lid




BKW

RENT-A-CAR

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

Name (as in C) .[_\1

NRIC/Passport No:- S %‘_S 1.:7 g.g .t Date of Birth: [ 5/ ¢ '? Z E_'_‘B/
Address: (2= IV bus B A e
H ( O - 5( d ':H'-Z—e t";_§

2 )
Name & Address of Employer

-

Driving Exp: Il

Passed Date: J&M

= #8538 TYL0

DRIVER'’S PARTICULARS

Occupation

Driving Licence No:

D/L Type: Local/lnt'liiOthers:

\ Tel(0)

Name (as In I/C)

NRIG/Passport Mo: DateofBirthe
Address: Age:
5{ )
Occupation Driving Exp Yrs
Driving Licence No: Passed/ Expiry Date:
QDIL Type: Localint'liOthers: Contact No: -/

BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD

120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Cenlre Singapore 169208 Tel; 6738 7777 Fax: 6738 6666
ACRA No: 20-0106276-0 GST Reg, No: 20-0106276-
24 HOURS HELPILINE : 6223 1122

VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

vHA No: P 3407

o .
Security Deposit : §

""L-'O'ﬁ'whr“rr ; E—k 'T 6=
rleer s Own Vehicle No: QM'{J}, :H 2 2 BHepIace Veh ND h
Loan Vehicle No: ) 4 S ) ] F Y VR No: i
"Make & Model: l A qu_l Q’?—»_ﬂ:k AutolManuaI Group:
CHARGES : cts
Daily day @% ‘/ Per day Do
Weekly/Monthly week @§% Per wesk/Monthly
Others
CDW/PAI @$ Per cay/Monthly
Delivery/Collection Sve
GST
OR No: (A) SUB-TOTAL
Fetrol Level |y 71— 14 12 a F 5
a ™~
sucharge | IN V
Firsl km FREE per day ':r ’/ L
Excess mileage is chargeable
\iﬂ_____ cents per km TOTAL CHARGES

Bank: ?)S Q

\-l--

CASHINETSVISAMC/RRIEX/SHA No: CAeS, WA ¢ CFFS

-

—

L

INDICATE:
A - Accidants
O - Dents

S - Scratches
X « Crack

| have read and agree 1o the tarms and condition @

Expiry Date: \Z]‘Z ‘l| Card ID No: 85(-6§}

Name as in Card: P\LQHAR-% N@"

NON WAIVER EXCESS (Subject to GST): S 200 /7
AGCESSORIES CHECK |

O Data Cards T Camera Systems [ HubCap [ Radio/ CD Cartridge
O Jack O Tyre Opener [ Petrol Cap [ Spare Tyre

(% :

A

i bolh sides of this agreement. If | have presented a chargefcredit card for payment. | agree that all amounts
payable under this agreement and for parking and traffic Infringements may be billed to that account and my signature above will be considered to have been
\made on the chargefcredit card voucher. All information | have been given BKW Rent A Car Pte Lid in conneclion with this agreement is true. )

Hirer's Signature : Additional Driver's Signature :

SINGAPORE Use Only

( IMPORTANT
The Hirer and the authorized driver must be over 23 years of age and under 65
yrars and be holding valid driving licenses and have a minimum of 2 years regular
and qualified driving experience. Failure to observe slipulalion may return all
damages cosis lo be Bomne by lhe Hirer/the Authorised Driver,

2. All vehicles are supplied with petrol and should returned with pelral level likewise
A service charge of $5.on lop of & pelroi surcharge is payable by the hirer should
he [all o return the vehicle aline appropriale pealrol fevel,

3, No refund for early relurn of vehicle, The hirer shall be siable for addilional charges
for any late relurm at the 1ate shawn per hour per day. Inclusive of COW andfor PAI
where applicable. Any returns afler our operation hours will be charged as a fult
day rental

4 Us::e of Ihe vehicle for illegal purpose (For instance: in connaction with thefl, drug
peddling or tratficking, smugghng), is siricily prehibited.

5. Mehicle strictly for Singapore use only and niay not be driven cul of Singapore
wilhout prior writlen consent of BKW Rent A Car Ple LId. The hirer is liable for a
penalty fee of 3200 in sddilional to the appropriate insurance lop up in the case
of non-disclosuie of Malaysia usage

G. The hirer and/or driver shall be responsible for all damages ar [osses howsoever
caused, ali trafiic viclations. fines and penalties imposed an the vehicle for
whatsoever reason in respecl of or In connection with it's use or nperalion

7. The hirer andfor driver shall be tespansible for all claims, damages, losses,
increased insurance premiums, non-wavier excess and cost expense (including

legal costs on a full indenwmily basis), whalsoever and howsoever broughl agsins, w
suffared or incurred by you In respect of the vehicle or lhe use or Lhe operalion of the
vehicle, Full excess amount have to be paid imrmediately in the event of an accident
The owner reserve Lhe right not to replace an replacement vehicle if an accident
accurred. Any damage 10 the car will be repair at BKW authorized workshep
&. Smoke or permil smoking and transport of pets in the vehicle are vot allowed. Any
offensive smell 2.g. cigarelte, durian or pet's smell, lhe hirer and/or diiver shail bear
the cosi of remaoving the offensive smeall or pel's hair between $200 - $400.
9. The Hirer agrees thal a purclured hyre, emply petrol tank, Ioss of vehicle's key or
locked keys inside of vehicle, by ilself, does nol constitute a breakdown and that
inn lhe event the owner's 24-Hours Emergency Service is called upon to respond 1o
such occurrence, the Hirer shall bear the cost of such response al $50.00 per lrip
10, in case of accident, the hirer shall repart to rental office immadiately, An accident
repor must be made wilhin 24 hours, Failure {o comply, the hirer will have to borne
all iability from all parties claim, Full excess amount have la be paid immedialely in
the event of an accident.
I'he hire:/Driver also have tha responsibility to ensure that the radiator water level
i the: caris sufficient and do nol drive when Lhe vehicle is stall and does nol have
suificient watsr. Any damage to the anglne will be bear by lhe hirer/driver
12 Al customar s’ data will be Kept striclly confidential and is solely used for the
wirpese of completing the sales tansactions and other
undarsiand and agre lo the personal data collecil
Terms and Conditions Page.

1

=

13.

Dale Out Time Qut Mileage Check By

Remarks

(2fon)2d 1 F20[gySel | T

river Signature

b

¢~ Relurm Of Vehicle: The Hirer Driver |s Required To Sign

Day And Time The Vehicfe Is Returned To BKW Rent A Car Ple Ltd And The Same Shall Be Accepted As Conclusive Evidence Of The Same
Questioned On Any Account Whatsoever. And | had cleared my belenging items from the rental vehicle {cashcard, parking coupons, ato}”

Deemed To Be The

Date In ! Time tn Mileage Check By Remarks
Q] 288y o | A



\K1) ELROKARS LEASING PTELTD CO. REGN. NO : 199200636C

Eurokars Group GST REGN. NO: M90364005A

TAX INVOICE

Invoice to: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Invoice number: 22658
5 MAXWELL ROAD GST REGN NO: M90364005A
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 20/10/2020
MND COMPLEX Account number: E0003
SINGAPORE 069110 Invoice Currency: SIN
Term of Credit: C.0.D.
Page: 1
Description GST Amount
NAME OF CUSTOMER: EXCA RENTAL PTE LTD S 800.00

CUSTOMER VEHICLE: SMA7122B

LOAN'S CAR MODEL: MITSUBISHI LANCER
LOAN'S CAR REGN NO: SLM5197Y

BEING CAR RENTAL CHARGE FOR 8 DAYS
FROM 21.09.2020-29.09.2020 @$100.00/DAY

code Description % Rate Goods Total GST Total SIN Total
s standard Rate 7.000 800.00 56. 00 856.00
"~ TYotals for invoice ~800.00  56.00 856.00

For Eurokars feasing Ptg) Ltd

%

Authorised Signafure

Head office & Postal address:

Eurokars Centre

12 Sungei Kadut Ave Tel : 6363 3003 Emergency Breakdown Email : leasing@eurokarsieasing.com
Singapore 729648 Fax: 6369 3003 Tel : 9760 3003 www.eurokarsleasing.com



! 'j'j Auto

W W wm Consultants
A BA B Pte ltd

51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/EQI20008419/R1ga3
01 SEPTEMBER 2020

NORJANNA BTE ALI

BLK 179 LOMPANG ROAD
#02-16

SINGAPORE 670179

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA 3675Z AND SMA 7122B ON 05/08/2020

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster
Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy
taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SMA 7122B.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

\\ ' . ..
)
CECILIA CHONG
Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274
FAX: 6741 4108
EMAIL: ceciliachong@]lkkauto.com

c.c. EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 3:18 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Requesting for TP survey / EQ ref - SMA3675Z / Our ref - SMA7122B / Doa Aug

5, 2020 (DM20HO01128-JG)

Hi Cecilia,
Please proceed

Announcement

In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” — except most of us are on a Work-From-Home
arrangement -reachable by phone or email or an arranged video call meeting.

Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises
can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis.

Regards,

Steve Lim

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax o

S Y S

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

Y

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 1:49 PM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cec: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Requesting for TP survey / EQ ref - SMA3675Z / Our ref - SMA7122B / Doa Aug 5, 2020
(DM20HO01128-JG)

EQ ref : DM20HO01128-JG

LKK ref : CC4/EQI20008419/R1ga3g2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMA3675Z (EQ-OI) AND SMA7122B (TP) ON 05/08/2020

We refer to the above matter.



This is a chain collision. (Ol last)
A letter was sent out to the Insured to noftify Third Party claim and NCD issues. No further feedback fill to
date.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD” at 10,747.62(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 20,679.57 $ 9.891.62
2. Loss of Rental W/GST(8days x $ 856.00 $  856.00 (8days x $107.00)
$107.00) W/GST
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ - $ -
Total | $ 21,535.57 $10,747.62

**7days recommendation for repair + 1Sunday = 8days

Market Value : $74,000.00 (est)
LTA Rebate : $43,448.00 (est)
Nett Value : $30,552.00 (est)

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chonyg | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ld

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong @[KkKauto.com | fax; 67414108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 August 2020 4:29 PM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Cec: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Requesting for TP survey / EQ ref - SMA3675Z / Our ref - SMA7122B / Doa Aug 5, 2020
(DM20HO01128-JG)

EQI REF: DM20H001128-]G
LKK REF: CC4/EQI20008419/R1ga3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
We had inspected TP vehicle SMA 7122B on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
e TP estimated cost of repair



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Stephen Quah <stephen.quah@mazda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 January 2021 2:47 PM

To: Jen Lim

Cc: Jess Francis Carlos; Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jessica Harry Shastri; Cecilia Chong (LKK
Auto); SG Mazda AR Team

Subject: RE: Check items / EQ ref - SMA3675Z / Our ref - SMA7122B / Doa Aug 5, 2020

(DM20HO01128-JG) *** LKK REF: CC4/EQI20008419/ga3 LOD

Hi Jen,

As per requested.

Account Name TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

Account Number 003-916027-5

Bank Name DBS BANK LTD

Bank & Branch Code BANK CODE: 7171 , BRANCH CODE: 003

With Regards
Mazda AR Team
Email: SGMazdaARteam@eurokars. com. sg

From: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars. com. sg>

Sent: 20 January 2021 14:35 PM

To: Stephen Quah <stephen. quah@mazda. com. sg>

Cc: Jess Francis Carlos <{jess. carlos@eurokars. com. sg>; Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars. com. sg>;
Jessica Harry Shastri <jessica.shastri@eurokars. com. sg>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
{CeciliaChong@lkkauto. com>

Subject: RE: Check items / EQ ref — SMA3675Z / Our ref — SMA7122B / Doa Aug 5, 2020 (DM20H001128-JG) s
LKK REF: CC4/EQI20008419/ga3 LOD

Hi Stephen,

Please assist to fill in bank details.

Account Name
Account Number
Bank Name

Bank & Branch Code

Regards,

JEN LIM

Insurance Claims Admin
27A, Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042

5) ELROKARS SERVICES

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto. com>
Sent: 20 January 2021 1:23 PM




