Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 September 2020 2:34 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore)

Cc: Chee Steven (VGS - SG/Singapore); Tang Shu Shi (VGS - SG/Singapore); Kong

Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore); Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore); Cheong
Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore)
Subject: RE: FINALISATION SMK8631Pd

Hi Germaine,

Please take note finalize amount before excess $1,500 is $17,584.99.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-3062 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 September 2020 11:01 AM

To: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <Germaine.ong@vw.com.sg>

Cc: Chee Steven (VGS - SG/Singapore) <steven.chee@vw.com.sg>; Tang Shu Shi (VGS - SG/Singapore)
<shushi.tang@vw.com.sg>; Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; Wong Meiy (VGS
- SG/Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>;
Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISATION SMK8631Pd

Hi Germaine,
Finalised amount of $ 16,084.99 / 8 days of repair is confirmed

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Ong Germaine (VGS - SG/Singapore) [mailto:Germaine.ong@vw.com.sd]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 August, 2020 4:11 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Chee Steven (VGS - SG/Singapore); Tang Shu Shi (VGS - SG/Singapore); Kong Charmaine (VGS - SG/Singapore);

1



Wong Meiy (VGS - SG/Singapore); Cheong Pearlyn (VGS - SG/Singapore)
Subject: FINALISATION SMK8631Pd

Dear Rasul
Pls see attached finalisation

COR: $ 16,084.99

8 Working days

Vehicle is still in mid of repairing, we are doing early finalisation

Best Regards,

Germaine Ong

Body and Paint Department
Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
17 Tuas ave 9

Singapore 639197

Hp: +6592361588
germane.ong@vw.com.sg
http://www.vw.com.sg
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