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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 12:40 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Kazali Haji Selahudin; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Part Price for Toyota Prius G4 Part

Hi Bryan, 

 

We shall settle per your offer. 

 

Tan Pei Wei 
Manager (Taxi Accident Repair) 
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 
T: (65) 6214 8350  
W: www.cdge.com.sg 

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 11:24 AM 

To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>; Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

<Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Part Price for Toyota Prius G4 Part  

  

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment 

unless you know the sender.  

 

Hi Kazali 
  
This is an older version of Prius and the price for the headlamp in your estimate is $3,455.00. The 2 prices 
that you have provided in your email below does not correspond to the price as listed in your estimate.  
  
I believe the price of S$2,637.60 for headlamp is correct for this model Prius. The computer sub-assy or 
commonly referred to as headlamp ECU comes separate from the headlamp ie it is not an assembly. For 
this taxi SHC 1323B, the headlamp ECU was not damaged. Hence, we have no alternative but to revise 
the price of the front headlamp to $2637.60. 
  

Best Regards, 
Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 8:56 AM 

To: Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Part Price for Toyota Prius G4 Part 

  

Dear Taufikh, 
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As spoken, please find the details of the parts number below. 
  
TOYOTA Prius (G4) 
  

1) 81185-47890          - Unit Assy, Headlamp, LH - List price is S$2637.60 

  

2) 81056-47860          - Computer Sub-Assy, Headlamp, LH No.1 - List price is S$3772.50 

  
Please note these are our (CDGE) parts number. 
  
 

Best Regards 

Kazali Hj Selahudin 

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 

Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843 

  

 

From: Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 22 December 2020 5:31 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg> 

Subject: Part Price for Toyota Prius G4 Part  

  

Hi Taufikh, 

  

Left Hand Head Lamp (Toyota Prius G4). List price is S$2637.60 

Head Lamp assy with Sensor. List price is S$3772.50 

  

FYIP. 

  

  

Tan Pei Wei 
Manager (Taxi Accident Repair) 
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 

T: (65) 6214 8350  
W: www.cdge.com.sg 

 
  

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify 

us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents 

therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation 

Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein 

shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a 

written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.  

 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you 

to print this only if necessary.  

 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]  
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