Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 August, 2020 10:22 AM

To: 'Serene Ler'; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: D20003185MFSH (FIRE CASE) CT20080129 Taxi SHC3097R on Fire DOA:
10/08/2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 11:32 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Chris Lim Gan Koon <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CTPL - Doris Lim Puay Noi <doris_lim@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; jumanibm@cdge.com.sg
Subject: FW: D20003185MFSH (FIRE CASE) CT20080129 Taxi SHC3097R on Fire DOA: 10/08/2020

Importance: High

Dear Bryan,
We refer to the above subject matter.

Please find attached the accident report, estimated repair cost and workshop details for your urgent attention:-

Spark Car Care
59 Loyang Drive
Singapore 508969
Kindly contact Mr Jumani @ 62148315 if you need any other information.

We would like to appoint you for the survey as well as investigation into the cause of fire for this matter. Please
revert for instructions.

Please do the necessary investigation on the repairs, service, maintenance and replaced parts as per the
maintenance record. Please also comment if the vehicle is deemed as roadworthy and can be released to driver
etc.

Please acknowledge receipt.
Regards,

Serene Ler
Motor Claims



MS First Capital Insurance Limited

A Member of EEEEEN Insurance Group
36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 | Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3580 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C
Motor Claims: motor_claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Website: www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home
arrangement. However, we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will work to
respond in a timely manner.

We appreciate your kind understanding. Stay safe.

*With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be

www.msfirstcapital.com.sg.

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.first-insurance.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Doris Lim Puay Noi <doris_lim@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 1:13 pm

To: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CTPL Motor
<CTPL@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Teo Yhee Wei <YheeWei Teo@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; Philip Chia Chee Yong <philipchiacy@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; Roger
How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Arthur Liow Yi Foong
<arthur_liow@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Subject: CT20080129 Taxi SHC3097R on Fire DOA: 10/08/2020

Importance: High

Dear FCl Team

Pls assist to appoint surveyor for the above matter.
Taxi is grounded at 59 Loyang Drive.
Kindly contact Mr Jumani@ 62148315 if you need any other information.

Thank you.

Regards

Doris Lim

Fleet Safety Department
ComfortDelGro Taxi

DID: 6550 8606/ Hotline: 6550 8768



#ComfortUnited, Together We Can Overcome

From: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 11:40 AM

To: Doris Lim Puay Noi <doris lim@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Cc: Teo Yhee Wei <YheeWei Teo@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; Philip Chia Chee Yong <philipchiacy@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; Roger
How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Arthur Liow Yi Foong

<arthur liow@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Taxi SHC3097R on Fire , No Injury, Fire already extinguished

HI Doris

as your requested

see attached - Estimate
Best Regards
Jumani Masudin

Taxi Accident Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Tel. 6214-8315 / Fax. 6546-8156

From: Doris Lim Puay Noi <doris_lim@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 August 2020 9:54 AM

To: Chiang Liat Choon <chianglc@cdge.com.sg>; Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com>; Ng Nyuk Phin
<ngnp@cdge.com.sg>; Lim Kwok Eng <limke@cdge.com.sg>; Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>; Jumani Bin
Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Teo Yhee Wei <YheeWei Teo@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; Philip Chia Chee Yong <philipchiacy@cdgtaxi.com.sg>; Roger
How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Arthur Liow Yi Foong

<arthur liow@cdgtaxi.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: Taxi SHC3097R on Fire, No Injury, Fire already extinguished

Hi all

Pls assist to prepare the estimated for us to notify MS FCI for the surveyor later.

Regards
Doris Lim

Fleet Safety Department



ComfortDelGro Taxi
DID: 6550 8606/ Hotline: 6550 8768

#ComfortUnited, Together We Can Overcome

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary.

CityCab Pte Ltd Registration No. 199502839G

Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199303821R]




