Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Hi Team,

Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Thursday, 13 August, 2020 9:53 AM

Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Loganathan Agoram; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

FW: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH
AUGUST 2020 || C10006987

TP Sketch.pdf

We would like to request TP PRS for GBH5853G. Our insured has not reported yet.

Contact Person

Eric Lee 8269 9999

Email Address

teamautogl@gmail.com

Survey Address

160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Kindly confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla

Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853

E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 5:52 PM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: Re: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 2020 | |
C10006987

Dear Sirs,

With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as
the SJE for subject claim.

Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999

Email Address teamautogl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Thank you for your kind attention to our request.
Cheers,
Peach

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 3:41 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref)
Dated 12™ AUGUST 2020, Time around 1200HRS

@ HOUGANG AVE 3 TOWARDS ANG MO KIO

We represent our client; LYE HIN SERVICES, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client’s
vehicle registration number: GBH 5853 G and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SIR 5493 P.

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your
reference.

Kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors within 2 working days from today via email to the
following personnel:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8879 9997
Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

Cheers,

Peach



*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not
reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are
not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or
disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the
sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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