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HueyYon (LKK Auto)

To: Julie Mangubat
Cc: 'claims@budgetdirect.com.sg'; SUR; Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH 

AUGUST 2020 || C10006987
Attachments: AGI-LKKInvoice-AC2104214.pdf; GIA Rpt.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; 

LKKPhoto.pdf; Resurvey Photo-1.pdf; Resurvey Photo-2.pdf

Dear Julie, 
 
  
Enclose Survey Report  of  GBH 5853G. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Elaine | Reports 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

 

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 9:42 AM 
To: Julie Mangubat <julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 
2020 || C10006987 
 
Dear Julie, 
 
Please be informed that we are in the midst of preparing report.                 
 
 
Dear Reports Team, 
 
Please assist. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Julie Mangubat <julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 12 June 2021 10:51 PM 
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments 
<assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 
2020 || C10006987 
 
Hi Team 
 
Can we have the survey report for this case please. 
LOD is in. 
 
Regards, 
-Julie 
 

From: Julie Mangubat  
Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 11:00 am 
To: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'SUR' 
<sur@lkkauto.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM 
Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 
2020 || C10006987 
 
Hi Team 
 
Has this been finalized already? 
 
Please advise. 
 
Thank you, 
-Julie 
 

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2020 10:07 AM 
To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 
ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM 
Cc: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok 
<derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 
2020 || C10006987 
 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
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Best Regards, 
Summer Lee | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi 
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 13 August, 2020 9:53 AM 
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok 
<derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 
2020 || C10006987 
 
Hi Team, 
 
We would like to request TP PRS for GBH5853G.  Our insured has not reported yet.  
 

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999 
    

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com  

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14   Singapore 575722      
 

 
Kindly confirm.  Thank you. 
 
 
Regards, 
 
 
Ivy Ratilla 
Executive, Claims Admin 
 
T +65 6540 2185 
F +65 6725 0853   
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg  
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct 
Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) 
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 
email is unauthorised.  
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect 
the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and 
subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege 
have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.  
 

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 5:52 PM 
To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 
2020 || C10006987 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of  LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE 
LTD  as the SJE for subject claim.  
 
Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:- 
 

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999 
    

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com  

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14   Singapore 575722      
 

 

Thank you for your kind attention to our request. 
Cheers, 
Peach 
--  
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not 
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 
injuries.* 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2 
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final 
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.  
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Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

 
   Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956 
 
              
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
 
 

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 3:41 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: 2 DAYS NOTICE: GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) Dated 12TH AUGUST 2020 

  

Dear Sir/Madam,  

Road Traffic Accident Involving GBH 5853 G (Our Ref) and SJR 5493 P (Your Ref) 
Dated 12TH AUGUST 2020, Time around 1200HRS 

@ HOUGANG AVE 3 TOWARDS ANG MO KIO 

  

  

We represent our client; LYE HIN SERVICES, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving 
our client‘s vehicle registration number: GBH 5853 G and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SJR 
5493 P.  

  

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference. 

  

Kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors within 2 working days from today via email to the 
following personnel:- 

  

  

Contact Person Eric Lee 8879 9997 
    

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com  
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Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity   Singapore 575722    

  

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply. 

  

    
 

Cheers, 

Peach 

--  

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not 
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 
injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2 
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final 
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.  

       

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

 

   Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956 

  

              

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. 
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the 
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated 
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may 
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and 
any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, 
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please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this 
email is error or virus free.  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. 
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the 
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated 
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may 
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any 
use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please 
immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is 
error or virus free.  
This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. 
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the 
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated 
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may 
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any 
use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please 
immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is 
error or virus free.  


