Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 27 April 2021 8:28 AM

‘daniel@worldauto.com.sg’

'Geraldine Foong'; adrian22@worldauto.com.sg; 'Ganping’; Admin A

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020
DV_SMR 7415S.pdf

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary

action: -

e Authorisation to Act signed by your client.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg <daniel@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 26 April 2021 9:36 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg; 'Ganping

<ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We agree to your proposal for settlement.
Kindly forward us your DV for our necessary follow up.



Thks & Rgds,

Daniel Tan

Worled - Hite Dl Lol
Tel: 64513933

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, 25 April 2021 1:02 PM

To: daniel@worldauto.com.sg

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg; '‘Ganping'
<ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Without Prejudice
(Save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We are of the view that our previous offer is fair and reasonable.

Nevertheless, for an amicable settlement, we are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $1,470.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg <daniel@worldauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 5:06 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg

<adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg>; 'Ganping' <ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Dear Hsiao Tong,

The difference is only $87.50, which is less than what my client would had loss during the course of
repairs, less to say that your insured’s late accident report caused distress to our client, where he had to
resort to pay forward his repairs.

$1500 all in is a reasonable settlement. Kindly review.
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Thks & Rgds,

Daniel Tan

Worled - Hite Dl Sl
Tel: 64513933

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 3 April 2021 11:44 AM

To: daniel@worldauto.com.sg

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg; '‘Ganping'
<ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Hi Daniel,
We refer to your below email.

We are of the view that our offer is fair and reasonable. We are prepared to revise our offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 1,230.50
2. Loss of Use (3days x $60.00) $ 180.00 (as per benchmark rate)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.00

Total | $1,412.50

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg <daniel@worldauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 5:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg

<adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg>; 'Ganping' <ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020
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Dear Hsiao Tong,
Can we meet at $1500 all in?

Thks & Rgds,

Danied Tan
Worled - Hte Dl Lol
Tel: 64513933

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 5:29 PM

To: daniel@worldauto.com.sg

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg; '‘Ganping'
<ganping@worldauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $1,400.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg <daniel@worldauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 9:45 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Geraldine Foong' <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>; adrian22 @worldauto.com.sg; 'Ganping
<ganping@worldauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020
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Dear Hsiao Tong,
Our client incurred losses due to this accident, he maintained his claim on Loss of Use at $120/day for 3
days.

Kindly advise.

Thks & Rgds,

QZ{?}N’(/ K¢ an

Wertdd St De Lo
Tel: 64513933

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 9:33 AM

To: Geraldine Foong <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>

Cc: daniel@worldauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $1,350.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Geraldine Foong <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 5:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: daniel@worldauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020
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Dear Hsiao Tong,
Noted & thank you.
Regards,

Geraldine Foong

HR Executive

0Pte Ltd

5 KimChuan Lane, Singapore 537070
The Waorld of Tel: 64513933 Fax: 6455 7576
Premiur Email: enguiry@worldauto. com.sg
Automotive Service  Website: www worldauto.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 4:46 PM

To: Geraldine Foong <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>

Cc: daniel@worldauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 24 Feb 2021.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Geraldine Foong <geraldine@worldauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 3:30 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: daniel@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO.: SMR7415S & SKA3005G ON 07/08/2020




Dear Hsiao Tong,

Reference made to above matter.
Attached is our LOD.
Kindly advise your proposal for settlement.

Thankyou.
Regards,
Geraldine Foong

HR Executive

0Pte Ltd

5 KimChuan Lane, Singapore 537070
The Warld of Tel: 64513933 Fax: 6455 7576
Premium Email: enquiryi@worldauto. com.sq
Automotive Service  Website: www.woarldauto.com.sg




