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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: 9 December 2020 9:16 AM
To: C Yim
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G  & SMR7415S  ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON 

ROAD ON 07/08/2020

Our Ref:  CC4/AIG20008334/Gka3 
 
                
YIM CHOONG HING  
 [POLICY HOLDER] 
 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G  & SMR7415S  ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail below. 
 
Yes, we noted that the third party should not park at a no parking zone.  
 
However, under the motor accident guide (appended below), the driver that is making a  reverse/moving has the duty 
to ensure greater care and keep a proper lookout to ensure that it is safe to reverse  
than parked vehicle.  

 
 
As such, we are of the view that the liability is down against us.  
 
We hope this clarifies and we will try to settle the claim in best terms possible. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: C Yim <cyimpphr@hotmail.com>  
Sent: 8 December 2020 6:31 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G & SMR7415S ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
The car I hit was stopped illegally. I sent you the police report earlier. The car should not have stopped on the double 
yellow line and  I believe the police issued him a citation 
 
Yim 
 
Sent from Mail for Windows 10 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 3:30 PM 
To: C Yim 
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G & SMR7415S ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
Our Ref:  CC4/AIG20008334/Gka3 
 
                
YIM CHOONG HING  
 [POLICY HOLDER] 
 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G  & SMR7415S  ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
Please be informed that we have reviewed and we are of the view that the liability is more on our side because the 
Third party vehicle was stationary but we will try to settle the claim in best terms as possible. 
 
Thank you. 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: C Yim <cyimpphr@hotmail.com>  
Sent: 30 September 2020 12:43 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G & SMR7415S ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
Your email is noted.  
Please be advised that I received a letter from the Singapore Police Dated Sept 17 2020 that SMR 7415 S had also 
committed an offence . See attached letter 
 

 
 
Regards 
yim 
Sent from Mail for Windows 10 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Wednesday, 30 September 2020 11:21 AM 
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To: C Yim 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G & SMR7415S ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
Our Ref:  CC4/AIG20008334/Gka3 
 
                
YIM CHOONG HING  
 [POLICY HOLDER] 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA3005G  & SMR7415S  ALONG/AT 201 HENDERSON ROAD ON 07/08/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident reports and accident video, we are of the view that liability is not in our favour. We will therefore 
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call/e-mail us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c.        AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
 
 
 


