Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Yong, Joanne-LF <Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com>

Sent: 9 December 2020 3:38 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Seeking advice on liability - AIG REF: TP /3375167836SG (Accident between SMR
7415S & SKA 3005G (AIG) on 07/08/2020 )

Dear Sir,

Refer to your email below.

Agreed to your propose. Liability is clear

Thank you.

Best regards,

Joanne Yong

Senior Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1953
Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 8, 2020 4:06 PM

To: Yong, Joanne-LF <Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Seeking advice on liability - AIG REF: TP / 3375167836S5G (Accident between SMR 7415S & SKA
3005G (AIG) on 07/08/2020)

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Joanne,
We refer to the above matter.

TP’s accident video shows that Insured had reversed and hit TP’s stationary parked vehicle. However, the traffic police
outcome shows that TP parked at a no parking zone.

As such, we are of the opinion that liability is 100% against Insured and the police outcome against TP does not apply on
liability for this claim because third party vehicle was stationary at that time. We have informed our Insured and he is

agreeable to let Insurance handle and settle the matter.

Appreciate your approval/comments (if any) on liability please.



Thank you.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




