
1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 31 August 2020 3:13 PM
To: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident involving SLE6877D & SLA9933B Along Benoi Sector (TES-AMM 

Loading Bay) on 23 July 2018 //LKK Ref: CC4/ASM18013629/Kps3q2-1
Attachments: DS FORM_SLE6877D.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We confirm settlement as follows: - 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,932.17 
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100.00) $    700.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total $ 5,634.17 
 
Please duly sign the document enclosed and return together with the following docs to us (LKK): - 
 

 Rental Receipt/invoice. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 24 August 2020 12:13 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SLE6877D & SLA9933B Along Benoi Sector (TES-AMM Loading Bay) on 23 July 2018 
//LKK Ref: CC4/ASM18013629/Kps3q2-1 
 
Our Ref:  180475/07 
 
With reference to your email dated 24 August 2020. 
 
We view that your offer on Loss of Rental should be for 7 days.  Surveyor gave 5 working days excluding public 
holidays.  Therefore 5 days + Sunday + National Day = 7 days.  Therefore we are prepared to accept an offer of 
$5,634.17 as follows: 
 
Cost of Repair          $4,932.17 
Loss of Rental           $700.00        (5 days + 2 PH X $100) 
GIA Search Fee         $2.00   
 
Please confirm acceptance and arrange Discharge Voucher. 
 
 
Thanks and Regards 
 
Margaret 
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd. 
 
-------------------------------------- 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 10:00 AM 
To: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SLE6877D & SLA9933B Along Benoi Sector (TES-AMM Loading Bay) on 23 July 2018 
//LKK Ref: CC4/ASM18013629/Kps3q2-1 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement as follows: - 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,932.17 
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100.00)* $    600.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total $ 5,534.17 
 
*For rental, please provide a copy of rental receipt/invoice. 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  



3

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 19 August 2020 4:54 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Accident involving SLE6877D & SLA9933B Along Benoi Sector (TES-AMM Loading Bay) on 23 July 2018 
 
Our Ref:  180475/07 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong/Mei Kwan 
 
Enclosed are the following documents for you to process the abovementioned claim: 
 

1) Letter of Demand 
2) PT Car Rental Invoice 
3) GIA Search invoice 

 
We look forward to receiving your offer of settlement. 
 
 
Thanks and regards 
 
Margaret 
K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Dr #02-20 
Sin Ming AutoCity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 64527018 
 


