Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 5:04 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Final SKZ 6102H

Attachments: INV2020-00318.pdf; Inv00002603 - SKZ6102H.PDF; 6102final_210121_120828.pdf;

worshop email.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,
Already confirm with workshop.

Finalize amount $10,530.70. Repair day 5 days. (before excess $300.00 & GST).

Thank you

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pil’ll Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, February 22, 2021 11:06 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Final SKZ 6102H

Dear Sun Pin,

Please proceed finalise with wksp at $10,530.70 before excess $300.00 & GST.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin @Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 21 January 2021 12:14 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc @lkkauto.com>
Subject: Final SKZ 6102H

Hi Shiau Chan,
Please refer attachment and check.

Final amount $10,530.71 (before excess). Repair day 5 days. (P/P, before gst).
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If without problem I will email to workshop.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Ol Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933




