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Re: Request for 3rd Party claim survey - Accident between AU 9644K/SLK 2467Z on
20.01.2020 along Bukit Timah Rd.

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Tue 8/11/2020 11:27 AM
To:  paneurobikes@singnet.com.sg <paneurobikes@singnet.com.sg>

‘WITHOUT	PREJUDICE’
		SAVE	AS	TO	COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,  

We refer to the above ma�er.
 
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submi�ed by both par�es, the liability is
clear / under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline se�lement)  and shall proceed with direct se�lement
for the above men�oned case.
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisa�on
of repair to your client’s vehicle.
 
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by
our surveyor.
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted via email.

Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.

 
Dear All,
 
The survey has since been conducted, thank you very much.

Kindly advise if we can go ahead with Direct Settlement for this case.

Many thanks All, and stay Vigilant & Healthy.
 
Best Regards,
Kin Wah
Pan Euro Bikes Pte Ltd
Tel        : +65 6299-4929
Fax      : +65 6299-4430

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Mobil  : +65 9731-7133, +65 8121-2173
Email   : paneurobikes@singnet.com.sg

 
From: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey [mailto:AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com] 
Sent: Thursday, August 06, 2020 11:40 AM
To: PanEuroBikes
Subject: RE: Request for 3rd Party claim survey - Accident between AU 9644K/SLK 2467Z on 20.01.2020
along Bukit Timah Rd.
 
Hi Kin Wah,
 
We’ll appoint LKK to conduct survey.
 
 
Thanks.
 
AIG Claims Survey
 
 
 
 
From: PanEuroBikes [mailto:paneurobikes@singnet.com.sg] 
Sent: Thursday, August 06, 2020 11:28 AM
To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey; Chin, Lee-Ying
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for 3rd Party claim survey - Accident between AU 9644K/SLK 2467Z on
20.01.2020 along Bukit Timah Rd.
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Claims,
 
Kindly assist to arrange for a 3rd Party insurance claim survey for our vehicle AU 9644K.
Please find estimate and GIA attached.
 
Thank You, & Best Regards,
Kin Wah
Pan Euro Bikes Pte Ltd
Tel        : +65 6299-4929
Fax      : +65 6299-4430
Mobil  : +65 9731-7133, +65 8121-2173
Email   : paneurobikes@singnet.com.sg
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