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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020

 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 5:05 PM 
To: kennychan@alanutd.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
Our Insured statement is below: 
 

 
 
Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>  
Sent: 30 October 2020 2:33 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
Please forward us your insured driver statement ,as our client wanted to know the reason for rejected claim ,thank you . 
 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 
 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, October 02, 2020 11:01 AM 
To: kennychan@alanutd.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
Please be informed our principal is not agreeable to do direct settlement based on Insured’s version of the 
accident. 
 
Our Insured is making a counter claim against your client. 
 
Our principal will review upon receipt of further evidence. 
 
Please send us the accident video/witness statement/accident scene photos if any. 
 
Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>  
Sent: 2 October 2020 9:39 AM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
Please tell your principle insured , they don’t follow GIA BOLA , so we have no choice ,we will pass to lawyer . 
 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, October 01, 2020 11:20 AM 
To: kennychan@alanutd.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed our principal is not agreeable to do direct settlement on 50% basis. 
 
Our Insured is making a counter claim against your client. 
 
Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>  
Sent: 19 August 2020 1:12 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
As spoken yesterday ,please to remind you to reply us for the liability of 50/50 or rejected the claim as you are saying liability not 
clear ,both parties statement are saying both vehicle was stationery . 
 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 
 
 
From: kennychan@alanutd.com [mailto:kennychan@alanutd.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2020 10:42 AM 
To: 'Khanchna (LKK Auto)' <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
 
Dear Khanchna  
 
Morning , as we are asking for reason of the liability unclear , kindly update us the status ,thank you . 
 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 
 
 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, August 06, 2020 10:02 AM 
To: kennychan@alanutd.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN PC 1739R & SGX 4780X (CTI) ON 07/07/2020 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The liability is unclear and our Insured is also making a counter claim. 
 
We append below our Insured statement: 
 

 
 
We are checking with our Insured on the counter claim status/outcome. 
 
Thank you. 
 
"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


