Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: LOD - Our ref: SMP6137L (MIT) /Your ref: SHD4652B - TP CLAIM INDIA /DOA:
01/08/2020
Dear Sir/ Madam,

Our customer, SMP6137L holds your insured driver, SHD4652B, liable for the accident dated 01/08/2020 and would
like to claim against your insured driver.

Our customer's claim is for :

Repair Cost : $ 7,054.51
Loss of Rental : $ 1,070.00  $100.00 x 10 days
Total Claim : $ 8,124.51

If you minded to reach an amicable settlement with our customer, please let us have your substantive reply by
25/09/2020. Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he deems fit.

Best Regards,

JoJo Cheng

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4554 « F: +65 6565 1240 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

-
& Amember of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



CYCLE & CA| %IAGE

To:

Exceptional Journeys

Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Limited /
209 Pandan Gardens,
Singapore 609339

Attention: [Motor Claims Department]

Date: [17/08/2020]

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

Dear Sirs,

1.

I/We, the undersigned, am the registered owner of vehicle no. _SMP6137L__ (vehicle no.) (the

"Vehi;le“)‘

As a result of a motor incident occurring on _01/08/2020_ (date and time of accident) on/along
KF'E|TUNNEL_ (location) between the Vehicle and __SHD4652B__ (37 party vehicle(s)

number, if any) (the “Accident’ '), the Vehicle was damaged and has been sent in for repairs to be

conducted at Cycle & Carriage's workshop.

I/\We h'ereby authorize Cycle & Carriage to act for and on my/our behalf in respect of the following:

(a) to submit, make, settle and/or resolve any claims (the “Claims”) which l/we may have
against third party insurers and/or any other parties (“Third Parties”) arising out of the
Accident, in any manner as it deems fit;

(b) to receive payment from any Third Parties as settliement for the Claims (including accepting
cheques made out in favour of Cycle & Carriage); and

(c) to generally do or cause to be done all acts or things (including signing any forms or
documents or giving instructions to any Third Parties) which it deems necessary or
expedient for the foregoing purposes.

In addjtion to the above, I/We hereby further authorize Cycle & Carriage, for and on our behalf, to
execure and sign any discharge vouchers, indemnity forms and/or any other forms or
document in relation to or arising from the Claims.

For the avoidance of doubt, all payments towards settlement of the Claims should be made in
favour of Cycle & Carriage.



(&)

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Exceptional Journeys

I/We further acknowledge and recognize that any settlement which Cycle & Carriage may make for
and on my/our behalf in respect of any Claims may be on a without prejudice basis and without any
admission of liability in so far as any other Third Parties are concerned.

Thanh} you.

Yours|faithfully,

Name} CYCLE & CARRIAGE LEASING PTE LTD
NRIC / Passport No. / Company Registration No.: 307R
|



. INDIA

INTERNATIONAL

InsurancE

SINGAPORE
Serving the region since 1987

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
Co. Reg. No. 198703792k | GST. Reg. No. M2-0078806-X

64 | Cecil Street | #04 | #05 | #06-02 | 10B Building | Singapore 049711

Dffice (65) 63476100 Email  insure@iii.com.sg
Fax (65)62244174  Website www.iiicomsg

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lil-Direct Settlement (PODS)

india Re:MCT20080280
Claimant Ref :SMP 6137L

Well, CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE |-TD("{he workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement

with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$ 7,054.51

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (name

(repair cost), S$ 1,070.00  (loss of

«sefrental), S5 __ - (search fee), vehicle no. SMP 6137L that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on 01/08/2020 (date) at _KPE TUNNEL NEAR PIE (EXIT 2B)

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 05/08/2020  (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l arelam authorized by the owner

(location) involving vehicie no.SH

D 46528 (insured

CYCLE & CARRIAGE LEASING PTE LTD ("the third party

claimant”) of vehicle no.SMP 6137Lto make the claim as set out inthe above paragraph and we/l have full authority to seftle
the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant”.

Wel/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that
they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant" after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss
of use pursuant to the damage to _SMP 8137L (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Well confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settiement of all claims of "the third party claimant"
pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out ofthe same.

CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD

Well authorize youto paythe totalamount ofS$ 8,124.51 4

CLAIMANT:

Signature:

Name:
NRIC:

Address:

Nationality:

QOccupation:

‘\Q\/\

Signed by "thelworkShop" Twitfi chop)
! I CHENG

(G XK 4%3}1‘

20

Singape. 664339.

WITNESS:

Signature:

Name:
NRIC:

Address:

Nationality:

Occupation:

MEE

Signed by appoinied Surveyor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

199607198R

51 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Ind. Park S(408933)
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED

¢

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE Mﬁkm
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 65691056 MOTORS
TAX INVOICE
Co Reg No : 1977014696 GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
LTD ' Reg No/Reg Date SMPG137L / 02/10/2019
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Date In/Mileage 06/08/2020/ 21352
64 CECIL STREET .
$04-05 10B BUILDING Chassis/Package MMBSTA13AKHO01917
Contact No Make/Model MIT/19MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
. 06/08/2020 Colour/Trim AD6 COOL SILVER MET/ BK BLACK
[
|
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No Invoice/Credit Note No
CTPOO040 Cash 18/08/2020/ 11:34 TLC 881 / Jojo Cheng 55673 41459047
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNT88000 i 1650.00
RENEW FRONT BUMPER,i LH FRONT FENDER, LH WINDMIRROR,
REPAIR LH FRONT DOOF, LH REAR DOOR
E PNT98000 ; 1890.00
SPRAY PAINT FRONT B|JMPER, LH FRONT FENDER, LH FRONT DOOR
LH REAR DOOR, LH WINDMIRROR
B WHEELALIGNMENT _ 120.00
To Conduct Computerize Full Wheel Alignment
M SUNDRY 30.00
TRANSFER NEW RIM
A 54900099 _ 30.00
CHECK WIRING & CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 200.00
TO CARRY QUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
M SUNDRY 20.00
SUNDRY
S SPECIALISTJOB 85.00
WO:1239271 ACCIDENT| TOWED IN FROM AIRPORT RD TO CNC PG
X FACE,FR BUMPER 1.00 703.00 00.00 703.00
X BRACKET,FR BUMPER,LH 1.00 13.00 00.00 13.00
X FENDER,FR LH 1.00 497.00 00.00 497.00
X GARNISH,FR PILLAR,LH 1.00 30.00 00.00 30.00
X MIRROR ASSY,DOOR,LH 1.00 638.00 00.00 638.00
X WHEEL,DISC 1.00 687.00 00.00 687.00
Z TEAT
INDIA TP CLAIM SHD&@SZB
DOA: 01/08/2020
SURVEYOR: RASUL LKK|05/08/2020
Guanantee Your Warranty, Maintain with Cycle & Carriage!
Parts 2.568.00 Nett 6,593.00
Labour 3,890.00 7% GST on 6593.00 461.51
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 85.00 Total Payable 7,054.51
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 50.00 Total Due 7,054.51
Total(w/o GST) 6,593.00

Payment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or credit cards. Thank you.

Any dispute to the invoice must be made within 3 days. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Page 1 of 1



CYCLE & CARRIAGE LEASING PTE. LTH.
: - ‘ 208 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
[ LEAS I NG Tel +65 6251 8880 + Fax +65 6251 8998
www.cyclecarriage. com/sg/leasing

CYCLE & CARRIAGE incorporated in Singapore
Company Reg No. 201900307R

GST Reg No. MRAS00111X
| Tax Invoice

Diplomat Parts Pte Ltd. Inv No. :RMI20080010
209 Pandan Gardens Date : 19 Aug 2020
Singapore 609339 Ref !
Curr : SGD
Terms 1 7 Days
Sales : Felix Chan
: RA No. :RLA20030006
# Description | Qty UOM u/P Amt
1 Replacement Vehicle: SMM1435A 10.00 100.00 1,000.00

Name: Daniel Lim Yee Khai

Vehicle Model:|Mitsusbishi Attrage 1.2A
Rate: $100/day
Rental: 10 day|(05/08/2020 to 15/08/2020)
Reference No: SMP6137L

Remarks:

Replacement Vehicle
{

This is a computer anerated document, Subtotal Before GST: S% 1,000.00
No signature is required. 7 % GST on S% 1,000.00: 5% 70.00
Far Bank Transfer:. | Total Amt Incl. GST: S$ 1,070.00
SCB 01-063-8115-6

DBS 072-009109-4 |

For PayNow:
PayNow ID (SGD): 201900307RS01
Or scan QR code for payment.

Kindly send payment advice to
cclfinance@cyclecarriage.com.sg

PAGE1 OF 1



Traffic Police
10 Ubi Avenue 3

SINGAPURE Singapore 408865

Tel +65 6547 0000
POLICE FORCE Fax +65 6547 4883

www.police.gov.sq

Our Ref : TP/IP/32375/2020
Date : 20 August, 2020

DANIEL LIM YEE KHAI

BLK 130A LORONG 1 TOA PAYOH
#37-510

SINGAPORE 311130

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP6137L & SHD4652B ALONG KPE (MCE) 1.9KM ON 1
AUGUST 2020 AT 1149 HRS.

| refer to the above accident.

2. Please be informed that we have completed our investigations which shows that the
driver of SHD4652B has committed the following offences:

(a) Careless Driving Causing Hurt under Section 65(4)(a) of the Road Traffic Act, Chapter 276;

(b) Failing to Stop after an Accident under Section 84(1)(a) of the Road Traffic Act, Chapter 276;

(c) Failing to Render Assistance under Section 84(3) of the Road Traffic Act, Chapter 276.

Action has been initiated against the driver for the said offences.

3. If you have any queries, please contact the Investigation Officer, Clarence Lim at
telephone number 9734 8065.

Yours faithfully

HAFIZ FAIZAL

for HEAD TRAFFIC INVESTIGATION
TRAFFIC POLICE

SINGAPORE POLICE FORCE



9/9/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMP6137L (MCT20080280)
[SHD4652B]
TP
CYCLE & CARRIAGE LEASING PTE LTD
Aug 1 2020 11:00AM
(-]
Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd

| Reply || Reply All || Mark as Unread || Print Message || Delete Message || Forward |

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 03/09/2020 15:15 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$8124.51) - SMP6137L - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillai

Approved:8124.51.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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