Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 2:54 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Claims

Subject: RE: RE: TCS REF: AAD2007-116 -- Accident involving GBG675S & SHC5808T on
29/07/2020 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG20008100/Kda3

Attachments: image005.wmz; AAD2007-116 - DV.pdf

Without prejudice

Dear Jaslin
Attach duly signed DV for your action.
Hope to receive your payment soon.

*Due to COVID-19 virus, all correspondence will be by way of email only. Please let me know if you need the original signature copy of
the documents.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct of this
matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 24 December, 2020 4:03 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: TCS REF: AAD2007-116 -- Accident involving GBG675S & SHC5808T on 29/07/2020 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G20008100/Kda3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We confirm settlement as per your LOD.



1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,075.35

2. Loss of Use (2days x $81.13) (w/GST) $162.26
3. Loss of Use (2days x $50.00) $100.00
4. LTA/GIA Search $7.49

Total | $1,345.1

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 30 November 2020 4:41 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: RE: TCS REF: AAD2007-116 -- Accident involving GBG675S & SHC5808T on 29/07/2020 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG20008100/Kda3

Without prejudice

Dear Jia Le
Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claims.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct of this
matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Wai Yin Ng [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 2 October, 2020 4:10 PM

To: 'Jia Le (LKK Auto)' <JiaLe@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Zhe Wei Kek <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>
Subject: RE: RE: TCS REF: AAD2007-116 -- Accident involving GBG675S & SHC5808T on 29/07/2020 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G20008100/Kda3

Without prejudice




Dear Jia Le
Enclose is video footage for your investigation.
Our taxi was travelling straight on his lane, your client had suddenly swerved from the right and hit onto our taxi.

Hope to receive your offer soon.

Circumstances of Accident
On 29.07.2020 at about 1807hours, | was travelling straight on the third lane along Seletar West Link. Suddenly | felt an in
Vehicle B (GBGE755) which was travelling on my right swerved into my lane and hit onto my taxi's right side portion
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Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

**¥* please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 2 October, 2020 3:14 PM

To: Zhe Wei <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: TCS REF: AAD2007-116 -- Accident involving GBG675S & SHC5808T on 29/07/2020 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G20008100/Kda3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for our viewing.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
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Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Zhe Wei <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 August, 2020 4:04 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: TCS REF: AAD2007-116 -- Accident involving GBG675S & SHC5808T on 29/07/2020

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir

We are making a claim against your client GBG675S.
Enclosed is our LOD for your perusal and action.
Original hard copy will mailed to you by post.

Hope to receive your offer soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kek Zhewei
Claims Officer

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
Main Line :(65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6257 1330

/ﬁcag Website: www .transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com



