Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 November 2020 3:01 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: URGENT / REMINDER  Your ref: SHB621C [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES
SKE8878A (AIG'S INSURED) AND SHB621C ON 30/07/2020] SMRT Ref:
TAX/07/20/2066/1g

Attachments: 4832_001.pdf

Dear Jia Le,

Our hirer had just informed us that his lawyer did not claim for his loss of income. As such, we re-quantify our claim
to include same as follows:-

Cost of Repair $550.00
Loss of Rental $654.84 ( 6 daysx $109.14 )
Loss of Income $360.00 ( 6 dayx $60.00 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $1,571.84

Please let us have your offer by 9" November 2020. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr
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Customer Code: 3000063

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

2 Tanjong Katong Road, Tower 3, Paya
Lebar Quarter, #08-01, Singapore 437161
Tel: 65 69083530 Fax: 65 69083592

Tax Invoice

GST Reg No. MR-8500001-7
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD CRN 11990042802
Invoice No. IVv200900055
Block Unit Date ¢ 04.09.2020
Claims Vehicle No. SHB621C
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Deﬁ&”M@ni Your Ref No. TAX/07/20/2066
SINGAPORE 757705 N Our Ref No. 24107709
- Terms 30 Days
Description Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost % Amount
LUMP SUM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 $ 550.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION
GRAND TOTAL S 550.00

Remark

Make/Model
Accident Date

TOYOTA PRIUS
30.07.2020

Payment Instructions

By Cheque: Crossed and made payable to "SMRT Automotive
Services Pte Ltd" with invoice no. indicated on the reverse
side. No receipt will be issued unless requested.

By Bank Transfer:

Account Name ¢ SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
¢ DBS Bank Ltd = SGD

Bank Account No.: 018-008617-4

Bank Name

Koo Yew Chung

Koo Yew Chung (Sep 4, 2020 17235 GMT+8)

Swift Code : DBSSSGSG

Authorised Signature

for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
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SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: TAX/07/20/2066
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 7/8/2020

ACCIDENT ON 30/07/2020 INVOLVING SHB 621C & SKE 8878A ALONG
HOLLAND RD TOWARDS CORONATION RD
This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 621C is $109.14 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

for Manager
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’ A Singapore Government Agency Website

Enquire Transaction History
1l

Log Date{Time; 03 Aug 2020/08:31:45

Assol Type: Vehicle Transaction Amount: $7.49

Asset1D; SKE8878A

Transaction Type; 18.32 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO Payment) Channel: External Agency

User 1D: ESASBAHO - BALQISH BINTE ABDUL HALIL Business Transaction Reference No.: 20200803083145643347
Search Date / Time: 30 Jul 2020 16:30:00

Insurance Company: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE, LTD.

Information displayed is correct as at the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs OK



