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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Peiwen <peiwen@procarcare.com.sg> on behalf of Claims 
<claims@procarcare.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 2:44 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; Claims
Subject: RE: ACC ON 30.07.2020 INVLG SJX 1959 H & SHA 4738 D *** LKK REF: 

CC4/FCI20008040/pa3 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
My client don’t have other evidence.  
 
Please proceed to close case. 
 
Thank You.  
 
Regards, 
 
Pei Wen NG 
Claims Advisory 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
 

 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts 
thereof. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2020 4:33 PM 
To: Claims 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: Re: ACC ON 30.07.2020 INVLG SJX 1959 H & SHA 4738 D *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20008040/pa3  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Further to our below email. 
 
Liability is unclear.  Kindly advise if there is any evidence from your client. 
 
Thanks. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 4, 2020 4:44 PM 
To: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACC ON 30.07.2020 INVLG SJX 1959 H & SHA 4738 D *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20008040/ka3  
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please provide us evidence i.e. video/ scene photo and arrange for TP survey. 
  
Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Khanchna via email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 
  
From: Peiwen <peiwen@procarcare.com.sg> On Behalf Of Claims 
Sent: Tuesday, 4 August, 2020 2:32 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 



4

Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg> 
Subject: ACC ON 30.07.2020 INVLG SJX 1959 H & SHA 4738 D 
  
Hi Sir, 
  
Please advise liability status for said accident. 
  
Thank You.  
  
Regards, 
  
Pei Wen NG 
Claims Advisory 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. 
  


